Clty of M* o

Regular City Council Meeting
Monday, February 5, 2024, at 5:30 PM
City Council Chambers, City Hall (10 3rd Ave SW)
Any person needing special accommodation for the meeting is requested to notify the City
Clerk’s office at 857-4752.

1. ROLL CALL

2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

3. MAYOR'S REPORT

3.1. PROCLAMATION

Documents:

GIVING HEARTS DAY PROCLAMATION 2024.PDF

4. CITY MANAGER'S REPORT

Documents:

02-05-2024 CITY MANAGER REPORT.PDF

2023 CITY OF MINOT YEAR END REPORT- FIRST DISTRICT HEALTH UNIT.PDF
2024 -1 - JAN BOD AGENDA VISIT MINOT.PDF

MINOT COMMISSION ON AGING BOARD MEETING MINUTES.PDF

JANUARY 2024 MONTHLY REPORT- MUNICIPAL COURT.PDF

5. CITY ATTORNEY'S REPORT
Documents:

2024-2.PDF

6. CONSENT ITEMS

6.1. CITY COUNCIL MINUTES
It is recommended City Council approve the minutes of the January 16,
2024, Regular City Council meeting and the January 16, 2024, Special
City Council meeting.

Documents:

01162024 COUNCIL MEETING MINUTES.PDF
01162024 SPECIAL CITY COUNCIL MEETING MINUTES.PDF

6.2. ORDINANCES
It is recommended City Council approve the following ordinances on



second reading:

1. Ordinance 5938 - 2024 BA - Law Enforcement Resiliency Grant
2. Ordinance 5939 - Traffic Restrictions for Transit Center Area

3. Ordinance 5940 - Fire Inspection Fees Ordinance

Documents:

ORDINANCE 5938 - 2024 BA - LAW ENFORCEMENT RESILIENCY
GRANT.PDF

ORDINANCE 5939 - TRAFFIC RESTRICTIONS FOR TRANSIT CENTER
AREA.PDF

ORDINANCE 5940 - FIRE INSPECTION FEES_ORDINANCE.PDF

6.3. ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVALS
It is recommended City Council ratify the following Administrative

Approvals.
Documents:

ADMIN APPROVALS 02052024.PDF

6.4. BILLS, TRANSFERS, AND PAYROLL
It is recommended City Council approve the payroll for the period of

December 17, 2023, through January 13, 2024, in the amount of
$2,668,830.48 and the bills and transfers for January in the amount of
$6,864,447.47.

Documents:

CITY CLERK REPORT.PDF

JANUARY BILLS PAID.PDF

JANUARY P CARD TRANSACTIONS.PDF
JANUARY ELECTRONIC TRANSFERS.PDF

6.5. GAMING SITE AUTHORIZATION- COMPANIONS FOR CHILDREN
It is recommended City Council approve the following organization to
conduct games of chance at the following locations:

Companions for Children (February 5, 2024 - June 30, 2024)

o The Putt District (17 S Main St)
o The Blue Rider (118 1st Ave SE)

Documents:

MEMO- GAMING SITE AUTHORIZATIONS.PDF



6.6. ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE LICENSE RENEWAL - SAUL'S
Presented by Mikayla McWilliams and Chief John Klug

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the alcoholic beverage
license renewal for Saul’s at 105 1st St SE (basement) for the period of
February 5, 2024 through December 31, 2024.

Documents:
MEMO - ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE LICENSE RENEWAL.PDF

6.7. MAYORAL APPOINTMENTS
It is recommended City Council confirm the following appointments:

o Trent Livedalen to replace Travis Mowbray on the MAGIC
Fund Screening Committee with a term to expire December
2026.

o Doug Diedrichsen to replace John Van Dyke on the Minot
Committee on Childcare.

6.8. MINOR SUBDIVISION PLAT: WEST MINOT 2ND ADDITION
Presented by Doug Diedrichsen, Principal Planner

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve a minor subdivision plat as
provided in Attachment A to create West Minot 2nd Addition.

Documents:

2024-01-04 - CITY COUNCIL MEMO WEST MINOT 2ND ADDITION.PDF
ATTACHMENT A.PDF

6.9. PLEDGED ASSETS, DECEMBER 31, 2023
Presented by David Lakefield

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the Pledged assets as of
December 31, 2023.

Documents:

PLEDGED ASSETS MEMO.PDF
12-31-23 PLEDGED ASSETS.PDF

6.10. ACCEPTANCE OF FY2023 STATE AND LOCAL CYBERSECURITY GRANT



PROGRAM (SLCGP) AWARD
Presented by David Lakefield, Finance Director

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council accept the FY2023 State and Local
Cybersecurity Grant Program award; authorize the Finance Director to
sign the grant award; and approve the proposed budget amendment
on first reading.

Documents:
FY23 SLCGP ACCEPTANCE COUNCIL MEMO.PDF

NDDES FY 2023 SLCGP NOTICE OF GRANT AWARD.PDF
12. 2024 BA - FY23 SLCGP AWARD (2024190002).PDF

6.11. 2028 NDDOT URBAN PROGRAM SOLICITATION (4829)
Presented by Lance Meyer

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council concur with the staff recommendations
and submit the requests to the NDDOT.

Documents:

2028 NDDOT URBAN PROGRAM SOLICITATION MEMO.PDF
BROADWAY RECONSTRUCTION SCOPING REPORT SIGNED.PDF
BROADWAY INTERCHANGE RECONSTRUCTION SCOPING REPORT
SIGNED.PDF

6.12. WARD COUNTY CONNECTOR RAISE GRANT REQUEST RESUBMITTAL (4657)
Presented by Lance Meyer

RECOMMENDED ACTION

1. Itis recommended City Council approve the funding request
to resubmit a RAISE grant for the environmental study; and

2. Approve the budget amendment on 1st reading.

Documents:

WARD COUNTY CONNECTOR RAISE GRANT REQUEST RESUBMITTAL
MEMO.PDF
13. 2024 BA - RAISE GRANT CONSULTING FEES.PDF

6.13. APPROVE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS FOR CANADIAN PACIFIC KANSAS CITY
RAIL QUIET ZONE AND AUTHORIZE A CALL FOR BIDS (4781)



Presented by Lance Meyer
RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the plans and specifications
for the CPKC Quiet Zone and authorize a call for bids.

Documents:

4781 - CPKC QUIET ZONE APPROVE PLANS SPECS CALL FOR BIDS
MEMO.PDF

6.14. LANDFILL MASTER PLAN AND SUPERFUND UPDATES (3700.1)
Presented by Jason Sorenson

RECOMMENDED ACTION

1. Itis recommended City Council approve the task order in the
amount of $118,000 for CPS, Ltd. to update the Landfill Master
Plan and Superfund site reuse documents;

2. Approve the budget amendment to allocate funds from
landfill cash reserves; and

3. Authorize the Mayor to sign the task order on behalf of the
city.

Documents:

MEMO - MASTER PLAN TASK ORDER APPROVAL.PDF
10. 2024 BA - LANDFILL CONSULTANTS REALLOCATION - CASH

RESERVES.PDF
TASK_ORDER_17_LANDFILL PLAN UPDATE ASSISTANCE.PDF

6.15. LANDFILL TRUCK SCALES RELOCATION - FINAL PAYMENT (4580.3)
Presented by Jason Sorenson

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the final payment for the
Landfill Truck Scales Relocation Project to Prairie Scale Systems, Inc.
in the amount of $28,468.00.

Documents:

4580.3 -LANDFILL SCALES RELOCATION FINAL PAYMENT MEMO.PDF
APPLICATION FOR PAYMENT 3 FINAL.PDF

6.16. COMPOST SITE LEASE AGREEMENT (2024-2025)



Presented by Jason Sorenson
RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the lease agreement between
the City of Minot and Trinity Church for the purpose of a compost site
location and authorize the Mayor to sign the agreement on behalf of
the city.

Documents:

MEMO - TRINITY CHURCH AGREEMENT (2024-2025).PDF
2024-2025 LEASE AGREEMENT.PDF

6.17. MINOT AIR FORCE BASE MUTUAL AID AGREEMENT
Presented by Kelli Kronschnabel, Fire Chief

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council authorize the Mayor to sign the Minot
Air Force Base Fire Department Mutual Aid Agreement with the Minot
Fire Department.

Documents:

MAFB MOU MEMO.PDF
BASE MOU.PDF

6.18. RESOLUTION ESTABLISHING FIRE PERMIT, LICENSE, AND INSPECTION FEES
Presented by Kelli Kronschnabel, Fire Chief

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the resolution setting the fire
inspection fees.

Documents:

FIRE INSPECTION FEES MEMO.PDF
FIRE INSPECTION FEES_RESOLUTION 3835.PDF

6.19. SEH SCOPE OF WORK - DESIGN FOR ELECTRICAL VAULT REHABILITATION
Presented by Jennifer K. Eckman, Airport Director

RECOMMENDED ACTION

1. Itis recommended City Council approve the Electrical Vault



Rehabilitation final design to be conducted by Short Elliott
Hendrickson Inc. (SEH);

2. Approve the budget amendment on first reading; and

3. Authorize Mayor to sign the agreement.

Documents:

MEMO ELEC VAULT_FINAL DESIGN.PDF
SEH PROPOSAL_FINAL DESIGN_2024 ELECTRICAL VAULT.PDF
11. 2024 BA - AIRPORT ELECTRICAL VAULT.PDF

7. ACTION ITEMS

7.1. EMERGENCY PURCHASE - FUEL FARM JET A PUMP
Presented by Jennifer K. Eckman, Airport Director

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council retroactively approve the emergency
purchase of the pump system for the Jet A fuel at the airport owned
fuel farm in the amount not to exceed $76,010.00.

Documents:

1. 20240205 MEMO FUEL FARM EMERGENCY PURCHASE.PDF
MINOT INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT PUMP PROPOSAL_UPDATE
QUOTE.PDF

7.2. PROJECT BEE AND BROADWAY CIRCLE ACTIONS
Presented by Harold Stewart, City Manager; Chris Plank, NDR Grant

Administrator; and David Lakefield, Finance Director
RECOMMENDED ACTION

1. Itis recommended City Council approve the Mutual
Termination Agreement with Project BEE for sub-recipient
agreements related to the Broadway Circle Project;

2. Accept Assignment of the Mattson Construction Contract;

3. Accept Assignment of the EAPC Construction Management
Contract;

4. Authorize the Mayor and Finance Director to sign all
necessary documents;

5. Approve the necessary Budget Amendment; and

6. Approve Staff proceeding with payment of pay orders prior
to a Second Reading.



Documents:

CC MEMO PROJECT BEE MUTUAL TERMINATION.PDF

84. 2023 BA - BROADWAY CIRCLE.PDF

TERMINATION AGREEMENT PROJECT BEE_FINAL.PDF
CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT ASSIGNMENT_2.1.24.PDF

SKM_C300124020515060.PDF

LEASE ASSIGNMENT_OISHI.PDF

LEASE ASSIGNMENT_WELCOME TABLE.PDF

7.3. 2024 WATERMAIN IMPROVEMENTS - PROCUREMENT WAIVER (4817/4818)
Presented by Jason Sorenson

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council waive the procurement requirement
for a purchase over $50,000 and authorize a purchase using quotes.

Documents:

4817 - WATERMAIN IMPROVEMENTS - PROCUREMENT WAIVER.PDF

8. PERSONAL APPEARANCES
9. MISCELLANEOUS AND DISCUSSION ITEMS

9.1. MINOT INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT (MOT) 2023-25 FORECAST AND ANALYSIS
The City's Air Service Consultant will provide a forecast and analysis
for the Minot International Airport and the industry.

Documents:

MOT CITY COUNCIL PRESENTATION FEB 2024 V1.PDF

9.2. RECYCLING UPDATE
Presented by Jason Sorenson

Documents:

RECYCLING UPDATE 20240205.PDF

10. ADJOURNMENT


https://www.minotnd.gov/966b75e8-7594-435f-a4f4-02120fbf81ce

City of Minot
Wayor 7o Bost

roclamation

City of Minot Mayor Proclaims Feb. 8 as Giving Hearts Day
WHEREAS, the goals of Giving Hearts Day are to raise awareness of the charitable non-profit
sector and its organizations in North Dakota, to promote online giving, and to provide donors
with the opportunity to multiply the results of their giving; and

WHEREAS, Giving Hearts Day is an example of the private sector assisting charitable, non-
profit organizations that improve the quality of life for many members of our community; and

WHEREAS, the charitable, non-profit sector supports individuals and families with programs,
materials and funds that promote, encourage, and sustain independence and self-sufficiency; and

WHEREAS, this year’s participating local charities include Camp Bentley, Cru Northern Plains
Campuses, Dakota Hope Clinic, Greater Minot Concerts, Habitat for Humanity Northern Lights,
Kritter Krazy, Matthew 25 Project, Men’s Winter Refuge, N.D. Association for the Disabled,
Prairie Grit Adaptive Sports, The Salvation Army, Youth For Christ, and Youthworks; and

WHEREAS, these charities have demonstrated a need for collaboration and resources, and have
combined their efforts for this 24-hour fundraising event that is dedicated to inspiring online
donations at impactgiveback.org;

NOW, THEREFORE, DO I, Tom Ross, Mayor of the City of Minot, hereby proclaim Feb. 8,
2024, as Giving Hearts Day in Minot, and ask public officials, business and community leaders,
and all Minot residents to observe this day with appropriate activities and programs; recognize
charitable non-profits, their staffs and volunteers who provide essential services to our
community; and support Giving Hearts Day by volunteering or providing financial support to
charities in Minot and across North Dakota and northwest Minnesota at givingheartsday.org.

Mayor Proclaims Feb. 8, 2024, as Giving Hearts Day

Tom Ross, Mayor, City of Minot

City of Minot City Clerk



Clty of Minow

Mayor Tom Ross

Members of the City Council
FROM: Harold Stewart, City Manager
DATE: February 5,2024

City Manager:

The Assistant City Manager has officially started in his position. Time was spent onboarding and
introducing Mr. Joyce throughout the organization, and transitioning some key projects and
information to him.

Significant time was spent by Staff assessing the Project BEE situation and preparing documents for
Council action. A special thanks to the City Attorney, the Finance Director and other key staff, and
the NDR/CDBG staff for making this matter a priority. This was an unexpected and time-
consuming need in addition to other priority projects.

Coordination and preparation has begun to submit an application to the EPA to conduct Phase 1 and
Phase 2 Assessment of the old Trinity Hospital properties. It is anticipated this will be on the
Council agenda for February 20"

Staff is planning to present information and options regarding ADA compliance and power assisted
doors at the February 20" Council meeting.

Staff has also begun working on updating the City’s Title VI plan, and developing an Emergency
Action Plan for the new City Hall and other City facilities.

Meetings attended included: Attended the Verendrye Electric CEO retirement open house; Liaison
Committee meeting; communication meeting with The Retail Coach; meeting planning the
upcoming State of the City; attended the Winter Employee Recognition event; Project Sentinel
quarterly communication meeting; Alcohol Ordinance Review and Rewrite Committee meeting;
meetings with CPSM representatives on the Fire Department assessment; City Hall employee
potluck; attended the 2024 Honorary Commander Induction Ceremony; monthly meeting with the
Parks Director; Central Dakota Policy Board meeting; Veteran’s Symposium Committee meeting;
American Battle of the Books at Hoeven Elementary; and various communication meetings with
Department Heads and staff.

Page 1 of 13



Finance
Director, David Lakefield

The Finance Director submits this report to provide additional information to update you on the
financial condition of the City. This report is intended to supplement the monthly/quarterly reports
that are published on the City’s website.

Tax Collections

Attached you will see the latest update on sales tax collections. After several months of strong
collections, we have seen collections retreat. YTD collections are still 3.33% ahead of 2022 and
20.18% ahead of budget. Hub City collections remained strong but off of last month’s collection
numbers and down $120,577 or 1.7% YOY.

1,600,000.00 @=2021 == )022 angme )73 e=@ «= 5 Year Average

1,505,563.41

1,400,000.00

1,296,304.37

1,200,000.00

1,000,000.00

800,000.00 b33

773,529.06
600,000.00 =

400,000.00 @
January March May July September November

Treasury Activities

As interest rates have stabilized, we continue to evaluate the best investment vehicle for funds that
are kept in reserve. We are following the markets closely and will work to lock in some of the
higher interest rates in longer term investments as the opportunities arise. These efforts have
included deposits in additional financial institutions within the city.

We also continue to work on implementation of an Accounts Payable Payment Management system
that will allow us to issue payments to vendors via electronic methods and reduce the number of
paper checks that we issue.

Page 2 of 13



Fiscal Year 2023 Year End

The Finance Dept. is working diligently to complete year-end activities and prepare for the
upcoming financial audit. This is a very busy time for staff and this is compounded by current staff
shortages. | appreciate the hard work and dedication of the Finance staff who are putting in extra
hours to keep things on schedule.

2025 Budget

Meetings are already starting in anticipation of preparation of the 2025 Budget. We will have a
number of challenges and uncertainties to work through with the upcoming budget. More
information will be forthcoming as we get further into this process.

Ongoing Projects

The first draft of the update to the City Procurement Policy is nearly complete. This effort was
necessary to bring the policy into alignment with the current process since the implementation of
the JARVIS computer system, simplify the process and improve compliance. Once complete, there
will be scheduled training for all employees who make purchases on behalf of the City. We will
also be looking at updates to the Code of Ordinances to update the process of handling budget
amendments.

We continue to work on several implementation projects including: Special Assessments,
Cashiering upgrade, JARVIS upgrade, Cityworks / Assetworks integration and a number of others.

Engineering
City Engineer, Lance Meyer

Department Updates

e InJanuary, the Department issued 3+ right of way permits and attended 3 DRT meetings.

e Cityworks software configuration is in its final stages. We are currently wrapping up contractor
licensing for 2024, as well as alarm and tobacco licensing. We are hosting the first sessions or
permitting training for contractors and will continue to do so in February.

e InJanuary, the Traffic Division had 11 emergency call backs and completed 38 work orders,
including 4 streetlight luminaire replacements, 4 signal led replacements and 13 hit traffic signs.

e In early-February, Stephen will be attending the ATSSA annual meeting via a public agency
scholarship offered by the organization. The ATSSA annual national meeting with the mindset
of innovating roadways, advancing safety and enhancing infrastructure.

e In December 2023, the Engineering Department submitted 5 Flex Fund applications to the
NDDOT. Staff is hopeful that decisions on the awarded projects will be made in February.

Page 3 of 13



Staffing

We have converted one open project engineer position to an engineering technician position and
are currently working through the process with a qualified applicant.

We plan to attend several spring career fairs across the state in hopes of recruiting a new
graduate to fill the project engineer position.

2023 Project Updates

Most 2023 projects have been completed and final payments issued.

2023 Signal Improvement and 2023 Signal Cabinet Improvement projects are awaiting material.
There are significant delays in traffic signal related equipment. Both of these projects are
anticipated to be completed by July 2024.

The 37" Avenue SW and 23™ Street SW traffic signal, as part of the 2022 Signal District-1, was
turned on in early January. Seeding and final checklist items will be completed in the spring.
2023 Sidewalk, Curb & Guitter is substantially complete but has punch list items that cannot be
completed until spring.

2024 Project Design

2024 Street Seal and Microsurfacing are both currently advertising for a February 13" bid
opening. 2024 Street Improvement, Patching, SC&G, Concrete Rehab, and Pavement Markings
will advertise mid-February for a March 12" bid opening.

2024 Signal Improvement for S Broadway and 16" Avenue SW was awarded and material is
being ordered.

Storm Sewer District 124 is in preliminary design. A public information meeting regarding the
district will take place in early 2024.

The Puppy Dog Storm Sewer project is in final design and has begun right of way acquisition.
Staff is aiming for a spring bid.

Fire Department
Fire Chief, Kelli Kronschnabel

CPSM site visit took place this past week. They took three days to visit all the stations, meet with
many of our stakeholders and seem to have a real understanding of our organization. We are
looking forward to their report in a couple months. January has been busy not only with
emergencies but also with the nice weather we are again able to get outside.

Page 4 of 13



INCIDENTS: REVIEWED INCIDENT COUNTS 429 4 429 398 31 8%
MINGT FIRE DEPARTMENT | Last Refresh: 1/29/2024 8:00 PM Incidents Filtered Not Reviewed Incidents YTD Prior YTD Aover PYTD % over PYTD

# of Incidents by Month

Incident Series #of Incidents
-
@z of Incidents © # of Incidents (Prior Year) X
& 1XX - Fire 3
]
& 2¥X - Overpressure Rupture, 2
Explosion, Overheat(no fire)
420
T 3XX - Rescue & Emergency Medical 323
Service Incident
@ 4XX - Hazardous Condition (No Fire) 14
T 5XX - Service Call 13
400 © 6XX - Goed Intent Call 28
I 7XX - False Alarm & False Call 45
[ 9XX - Special Incident Type 1
Total 429
380
2024
Top Stations by # of Incidents # of Incidents by Shift # of Incidents by Category
152
e [ HEZ  7ox 4%
Station 3 ... - 56
1
Station 5 - 51 e & s i
KT 0% 0% 100%
Station 4 ... . 3 P\Aﬁ\«\ # ol Incidenls
@Fir= @EMS @ Other
Qccupancies: Inspectiun Counts QOccupancies Inspected  Inspections | Inspections YTD  Inspections PYTD % Qver PYTD
MINOT FIRE DEPARTMENT | Last Refresh: 1/29/2024 8:00 PM 142 142 142 52 173%
=8
Number of Inspections Total Time Estimate Total Time Spent Inspector Inspections | Inspections | Inspections
Completed YTD PYTD
# Inspections =
— & | e | 1
@ Current © Previous Year
I 75 75 16
g I 4 4 21
Total | a2 | 12 | =2
100
50
Jan 2024 Mar 2024 May 2024 Jul 2024 Sep 2024 MNov 2024
MonthStart
# Inspections # Inspections
Passed
100 -
=
w
@
€
= Passed with Comme... 26.00
"]
50 3
]
=
Correction Notice Iss... 10,00
400
o I
Annual Construction Final
] 50 100

Inspection Type

Imerarting Clheanatinne Insmarting Tras

Page 5 of 13



Police Department
Police Chief, John Klug

The report provided for information updates for the police department is in the transition phase to
become more informative for the Council members. My intent is to start providing data that will give
you a monthly snapshot of activity within the Minot community. It will also continue to provide
information about the department’s operation. My intent to change the police reporting to the first
meeting does not work as intended since some reports are due before the month end, thus skewing
the data slightly. Therefore, the new format will be implemented more thoroughly for the second
meeting in February.

The police department is currently at 83% effective strength for sworn officers with 14 of the 84
sworn positions not fully effective or vacant. The current effective strength of sworn staff is due to
the following:

e 3 - Injury/Medical
e 11— Vacant positions

In addition to police officers, we have extended an offer of employment for our Parking Enforcement
Officer, who will be assigned to Patrol, and our additional Administrative Clerk for our Records
Section.

We have had a few resignations from our team in Central Dispatch. We are currently at 58% effective
strength with 7 of the 17 positions not fully effective or vacant. We are in the process of hiring for
the vacant positions so we should have some of them filled in the next month. The current effective
strength is due to the following:

e 2 — New Dispatchers in Training
e 5-—Vacant Positions

The police department responded to 41,103 calls for service in 2023. This is about a 4.5% increase,
1,922 more calls for service, then in 2022.

Airport
Director, Jennifer Eckman

Attached you will find the information pertaining to the airport’s operations during the month of
December 2023. | am including the City Manager so he may add the information to his report.

Statistics — (Additional statistics can be found here: (https://www.motairport.com/260/Statistics)

e December of 2023 there was a significant increase in enplanements and revenues across
the board over last year and mostly over last month. With the direct flights to Orlando-
Sanford Airport the increased capacity brought the overall load factor (% of seats filled)
down slightly, but still well above national average. The only revenue number which
was lower over last month was car rentals. This is typical seasonal activity with less
demand for rental cars during the holidays.

Page 6 of 13


https://www.motairport.com/260/Statistics

Staffing and Training
» Staffing —

» Part-Time — A new part-time Facility Tech started December 6, 2023 to help with the
heavy holiday travel.

» Airport Safety & Security Specialist — Interviews were conducted during the month
and an offer was made to an internal candidate. The start date for the new position
will be late-January.

» Airport Facility Tech — Since the Airport Safety & Security Specialist was filled with
an internal candidate the recruitment process for the vacated position has begun.

» Training and City P.R.I.D.E. —

* PRIDE Employee Committees - Airport Staff members continued to represent the
department on each committee.

» City Safety Committee — The Airport Facility Foremen and staff represents the
Airport on this committee.

« ADP Training — The Airport team continued to attended various trainings offered by
HR throughout the month.

Equipment and Facilities
* Equipment —
* Snow Removal Equipment (SRE) — The broken high speed plow continued to be out-
of-service as the City Shop looked for replacement parts to a broken leaf-spring
set. They were able to find some at a much lower cost than the initial quoted of
$45,000. The airport is now looking at a bill of under $10,000 for full repair (parts
and instillation).
» Tractor at third party for repairs. Been out of service since May 2023.
» Airside Equipment —
» Electrical Vault- The equipment in the vault continues to be an issue. The FAA and
the NDAC are in agreement to add this as a fundable project for the 2024 grants.
» Airside Electrical Generator — There is no change in the slow leak in radiator. We
are looking to see if it can be added to the other needs for the electrical vault.
» Two caster wheels on high speed broom had bad seal and needed total replacement.
+ Jet bridge 4 continues to exhibit electrical issues when connected to aircraft.
Working to coordinate a time for troubleshooting with airlines, mechanic, and
electrician.
* Facilities —
* Commercial Terminal —
= Fire Alarm — The fire alarm panel’s annunciator continues to not work
properly. Federal ATP grant was applied for the estimated $140,000 repair.
The last heard is early spring may be the soonest we hear. The team has
asked SEH to see if they could develop specs for an RFP.
= North baggage carousel in baggage make-up area was down for a couple of
weeks due to bad rollers. Airport staff were able to find replacement parts in
order to make necessary repairs.
= Began procurement and installs preparation for overhead door sweeps and
additional heat within tug tunnel and rental car offices.

Page 7 of 13



Community Engagement

Local Emergency Planning Committee (LEPC) — Airport staff participates in LEPC
activities.

Airport Association of North Dakota (AAND) — Airport Operations and Maintenance
Manager is on the board.

Service Organizations —

» Kiwanis — The airport director gave a short presentation and provided a tour of the

terminal during the month.

*  Optimist Club — The airport director spoke at the club’s regular meeting.

» Rotary - The Airport Operations and Maintenance Manager participates in Rotary.
Social Media —The top post for the month was the airport’s elf-on-a-shelf playing hide and
go seek on December 21, 2023 with a reach of over 3,800+.

Minot Area Chamber EDC Committees — Airport Director participates in the Infrastructure,
Energy, and Military Affairs committees and serves as an honorary commander of the 5th
Logistical Readiness Squadron.

American Association of Airport Executives — Airport staff participates in a variety of
subcommittees and working groups within this organization and its Great Lakes Chapter.

Public Information
Public Safety
T. Kvigne

Highlights and Takeaways

Fire Department

Work continues to increase the number of followers on both Facebook and Instagram. Since
the creation of this position, we have seen continued growth month over month in both
followers and reach. In 2024, our main goal is to see continued growth, which will be
monitored monthly.

In January, | gave a presentation at a command staff meeting for the Fire Department. The
presentation recapped 2023 in regards to social media metrics, community outreach, and the
goals of 2024.

Page 8 of 13



e Inregards to social media, January started off on a high note. Our Facebook account gained
146 new followers/likes, which put us at 4,063. The total reach we gained from our January
Facebook posts was 428,895, and they were all organic (organic meaning no ad campaigns
attributed to that number). To put this in perspective, we had a total of 168,802 in total reach
for the whole year in 2023. Our two highest reaching posts are attached below.

©) Post - Published on: Fri Jan 19, 10:15am

Overview
Reach @ Impressions @ Interactions @ Link clicks @
190H 18,705 168 -

Higher than typical Higher than typical Higher than typical
Reach
20,000

15,000

10,000

5,000

0
15m 4h Sh 16h 1d 6h 3d 7d 17d

Typical == Facebook post reach

Interactions ®

Reactions @ Comments @ Shares @ Saves @
Higher than typical Higher than typical Typical Higher than typical

Police Department

(8 Hey, want to see something cool? Here is a look at our new Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting (ARFF) apparatus that should arrive this spring. Did you know that Station 3, located at the Minot Intern...

Feed preview

Minot Fire Department
Published by T Mitchell Kvigne @ - January 19 at 10:15AM - @

Hey, want to see something cool?
Here is a look at our new Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting (ARFF)
apparatus that should arrive this spring.

Did you know that Station 3, located at the Minot International Airport,
responds to calls throughout the city, and is ready to respond to any
incident that may occur at the airport? ... See more

; W&

[4 View post on Facebook

e Similar to the goals of the Fire Department, continual growth of the social media accounts is
a goal for the Police Department. Since the creation of this position, the PD Facebook page
has seen growth. In January of 2023 the PD Facebook page had 15,386 whereas at the end of
January 2024 we have 18,984 followers, so an increase of 3,598 followers.

e InJanuary, I attended the quarterly Sergeant meeting to discuss the topics of interest in
regards to media releases, and created a media release form that the Sergeants can fill out
and send to me for potential releases. This is a step in the right direction in getting more
information out to the media and public, and allow our department to strengthen the

relationship with our community and media members.

Like Fire, the PD social media started off the year on a high note as well. In January we gained
284followers/likes on our Facebook. Our reach for the month of January was also impressive. Our

Page 9 of 13

-



monthly reach was up 116% from December for a total of 151,240 people reached. Most of this can
be attributed to a different recruiting tactic we implemented for job vacancies in Dispatch and
Police Officers. We utilized a simplistic approach, by drawing a job ad for both positions rather
than creating a graphic via photoshop/canva. These posts (attached below) generated a lot of
engagement throughout the community, and we interacted with people in the comments to

egncourage more engagement.

« -
&= | © Post: Published on: Thu Jan 11, 2:30pm

Overview!
Reach @

62,118

Higher than typical

Impressions @

Reach
30,000
20,000 T S
/’/V'
10,000 ~
,'//
=
5
0
15m 4n Sh 16h

Typical == Facebo

Interactions ©

Reactions @ Comments @

599 139 70

Higher than typical

« =
¥ O Post- Published on: Wed Jan 10, 3:21pm

Overview

Reach @ Impressions ©

38,351 40,084

Higher than typical Higher than typical

Reach

30,000
20,000

10,000

15m 4nh 9h 16h

Typical = Face

Interactions ©

Reactions @ Comments @

770 126

Higher than typical Higher than typical

Higher than typical Higher

Interactions @

64,689 819

Higher than typical Highe:

r than typical

1d 6h

ok post reach

Shares ©

than typical

Interactions @

982

Higher than typical

1d 6h

book post reach

Shares @

84

Higher than typical

Link clicks @

1,064

Higher than typical

3d 7d 17d

Saves @

i b

Higher than typical

We apologize, but this will have to do. The person who does our graphics is out of the office. Start 2024 on a high note, come work for us. http://tinyurl.com/MinotPDOfficerJob

Link clicks @

192

Typical

Saves @

2

Typical

Page 10 of 13

== Our graphics guy = NOT HAPPY. He mumbled something about "since you can do a better job" as he threw down some colored markers and information about another job opening. Drum roll please..... 3
o5t post

Feed preview

Minot Police Department
Published by T Mitchell Kvigne @ - January 11 at 2:30 PM - @

Our graphics guy = NOT HAPPY.

He mumbled something about “since you can do a better job" as he
threw down some colored markers and information about another job
opening

Drum roll please.... g

Here it is - Come be a dispatcher for us.... See more

[Daspatchers
 JE—

no

See insights and ads

Q@ 59

/) View post on Facebook

<

Feed preview

Minot Police Department
Published by T Mitchell Kvigne @ January 10 at 3:21 PM - @

We apologize, but this will have to do. The person who does our
graphics is out of the office.

Start 2024 on a high note, come work for us.
http://tinyurl.com/MinotPDOfficerJob... See more

Now  Hemo  Oeewnes!

WE  warT

Yoo\

Aeely By Fen. 2lst.

[/} View post on Facebook



Public Information
Communication and Engagement Manager,
Jennifer Kleen

Highlights and Takeaways

Work continues in our office in conjunction with Mayor Tom Ross, City Manager Harold
Stewart, Executive Secretary Anna Schraeder, and others on the upcoming State of the City,
which is set for Feb. 8 at the MSU Dome. The noon luncheon event will broadcast on the
City’s social media platforms, including Facebook and YouTube.

In January, the three staff members in our office spoke to the Minot Area Professional
Communicators group at a lunch. In addition to informing the group about the duties of our
office, we answered a lot of questions about City related issues, including streets, sanitation,
snow removal, and how the City, in general, decides how and when to communicate with
the public.

We continue to assist multiple City departments with communication efforts. The past
month was a busy one for answering airport de-icing questions, recycling and general
sanitation questions, as well as the usual questions/concerns about snow removal, street
conditions, etc. Our goal is to always answer these questions or concerns with facts, and the
level of support we receive from every department at the City continues to grow makes our
jobs much easier.

Construction season will be here before long, so we’ll begin working with Public Works,
Engineering, Traffic, Street, Water/Sewer and other departments on what’s on their
construction schedules for 2024.

Page 11 of 13



2 500,000

2,000,000

1,500,000

1,000, 000

Facebook Reach

500,000

Facebook Reach Month by Month

—

January
848,333
550,112

10,000

9,000

2,000

7000

6,000

5,000

4,000

Instragram Reach

3,000 i
2,000
1,000

a

January
5278
1ETS

685

Fabruary
4,039
3,211

3 (12 7
2023
—— (17 4

February
125,105
3014

Mach
55,748
179,383

March
E403
6,755

aprl
876,244
216,470

lay June

72,792
291,238

B5,B18
10,253,700

450,345
283,671

Instagram Reach Month by Month

April
7,580
4,560

May
3,168
3,085

21,835
3,041

Page 12 of 13

July
4,196
660

ALgust September
3,560,004 1519549
E2.95T 91319
‘\\:.-______.J-..___

L
it September
2,678 3,173
3,010 2,501

DOctober
2693
3201

Mavemb er December
14&m.211 836,738

96,584 116,536

L]
L]

Howember Destember

1,197 3,221

2,518 2,58



Newsletter Opens Month by Month

§

B

g

g

g

g

Newsletters Opened

E

January Februiany March April By June July Auigust September October Movember | December
e 20022 2423 5216 5898 6,452 3,E3 3,654 4137 3,564 3,989 4,196 2008 3971
2023 4457 4,157 4,564 3,895 3,E72 3,E12 2342 1,765 4,618 4,741 3,E30 3oz1
e 20124 3603

Twitter Reach Month by Month

9,600 ’ \
9,100
8,600 . . .
5100 2024 Social Media Footprint
7,600 30,000
7,100
6,600
6,100 » 75,000 -
5600 g
si00 O
L=
4,600 H 20,000
4100 &
3600 =
L7y 15,000
3,100 =
2600 W
2,100 §
1,600 10000
’ [a]
1100 =
g0 O =8
100 L 5,000 l
ecember
el 2 (12 ™ 607
el 202 ' larmary Februany Marth AE‘lI M':lll Jine .IE.- 724
ey =—Facebiock 25,609 . .
—r—Ins@gram 4166
s TR T 914
e f i Tisba: B39
Nz leiers) 4,734

Page 13 of 13



2023 Service Summary

FDHU Environmental Health
provided over 5,600 services
in the Minot community.

FDHU Health Promotion
served 1600 individuals in
Minot through our community
education and outreach
programs.

FDHU Nursing served over
2000 clients in the Minot
community though the
following programs: Optimal
Pregnancy Outcome Program,
High Priority Infant, HIV
testing and treatment, Ryan
White, Harm Reduction, STI,
and Family Planning. Nursing
services also provided over
11,600 immunizations in the
Minot community.

FDHU Mobile Unit served the
Minot community with 20
off-site clinics in the
community.

Program numbers are broken
down on the back of this report.

<f
o] b'S

Health Unit

"—\"| First District Health Unit

oy
~
~
P

4 2023 Services Agreement
o Year End Report

In addition to community services, the following
services were provided to the City of Minot per our
service agreement.

Material and personnel were provided to
conduct 605 water tests for the City Public
Works Department. The agreement allows up
to 700.

Material and personnel were provided to
conduct 57 wastewater tests for the City
Public Works Department. The agreement
allows up to 300.

No vaccines were administered to the City
Public Works Department staff in 2023. Up to
5 each of Hepatitis B, TDAP, and Boostrix TDAP
are allowed per the service agreement.

There were 123 two-dose boxes of Narcan
provided to the City of Minot for the Police
Department and Fire Department. There were
125 allowed per the service agreement.

2023 Report for the City of Minot

Healthy Peoplle in Healthy (Lommanitics



€20¢/L 33IAI95 O3UI JUSM J1UN 3[IGOIN

1T [i}4 oz o lo 0 [T [0 [0 (paziliqow shep o #) 1un a|IGoN |
*UDAIZ SBUIDJEA JO JaqUINU 3Y3 sjuasaldal ydiym suoreziunwiwi] 3dadxa SHSIA JUIL|I JO JdqUINU Y] S1UISAIAII IR 4
*H3 Aq paAIadaJ spule|dwod - saduesinN “$321AI9S Sulsinu [esauasd ‘(d1uopoyuio ‘Surieay ‘uolsiA ‘looyasaud) s8uIuaaLIS - YyieaH plIyd
*s8uluaauds ‘s321AI9s Sulsinu [esauad ‘suoildaful [BIIPIW S0} SDIIAIDS - YI|e3H I NPV
9€8LY L AT4%3) 98¢LE L0L 868 LE9C 0¢0¢ 8.8 0TvE S1v10l
L8LET 081017 YAZ4) 1444 8¢ 99 LTV 0 LLS UOIHIINN/DIM
0stT Y1t SET 0 1T 0 0 0 14 8unsal ‘Juale| ‘9AI3dE - sIsojndJagn L
LTV €LE LTV 0 0 0 0 0 0 weudo.d 301AI3S BULIAS
€6 G8 €6 0 0 0 0 0 0 pajjoJud # SUYM uehy
€T C €T 0 0 0 0 0 0 weidoid awonQ Adueusdald |ewndo
619 619 679 0 0 0 0 0 0 paAJas sajewul # - yijeaH |ler
LEE9 756¢ €88¢ OTT LET 999 €8¢ TL¢C £88 *% PIIY2 - SYISIA uoneziunwwi
89/LV1 1898 6LL0T (444 474 0S0T T09 T9¢€ €6ctl *% 1INPE - SUSIA uolezZIUNWW|
06 VL 06 0 0 0 0 0 0 syueju| AyuoLd YsiH
89/ 99 89/ 0 0 0 0 0 0 SAIV/AIH/1LS ‘Buluueld Ajiwey
TSPl CET G8¢€ 1% STl T9€ 8/.¢C 6 LLT S9JIAJBS Yi|eaH pliyd
1%0)7 97 LL (0]3 T [43 0ocT (44 61T sweJgold yieaH ynpy
ONISYNN
12°) TS TS 4 0 T 0 0 0 uonessa) 0ddeqo
9 1% 1A% 0 0 0 €T ot 0 syuedpipied ug suiddals
€L9T GQGET ELET 0T S €8 09 LC 99 uoinquasip uedleN
3 S¢ S¢ 0 0 0 0 0 0 painguisiq sieas Jed
12 LCT LCT 0 LT 0 0 0 0 8ulures] Janlas a8eIanag
SNOILONOYd HL1V3H
6T9¢ 6T9¢ 6T9¢ 0 0 0 0 0 0 S1s9] J91e M\
6vT 0 SS T S 6t LT € 6T SHWID Wa3sAS a1das
[47% T€ 143 T T € T 0 [4 suonoadsul 93e N [eUOlIRaII3Y
69 [43 4] T € 14 € S T saouesinN
9/¢CT 8GL 0v8 6T 8¢ 0ST 99 €V 0cT U}|BSH |BIUSWUOIIAUT - S9SUSIIT
0¢ LT 0¢ 0 0 0 0 0 0 Aujenp Jiy Joopu)
LSOT ¢/L9 1427 €T T€ LOT 1% 9¢ €8 suo3dadsu| Su18po7/poo4
Tv9 [4:1% 14514 0T € 19 8 9 69 Sulures) Ayajes poo4
0s 6C 13 T T C 9 [4 € suonoadsu| ateap|iyd
6¢ TC [44 0 T C 1% 0 0 suonoadsu| Suluue] /Wy Apog
HL1V3IH TVLNIINNOYIANI
€20C €20C €20C €20C €20C €20C €20C €20C €20C €202 Joqua2aq - Arenuer
lexol +IOUIAl piepy uepliays ENTILCEDN uea PN KusHon 9)ing neaunlog

*s|e303 AJuno) pJepn Ul papn|aul dJe sIaquINU JOUllAl, 31eq-03-1BdA £20T



l’} VISIT MINOT

BOARD MEETING AGENDA
Wednesday, January 17, 2024, 9 am
Location: Sleep Inn — Theater Room

Call to Order: Introductions

___Amanda Shappell __Randy Conway

__Megan Langley __Thor Nelson

__Paul Pitner __Pamela Hopkins

__Josh Galloway __Jesse Zwak

___Gabriel Mejia __ Stephanie Schoenrock — Executive Director

o Ex-officio Reports
e City Council Report — Paul Pitner
o Stakeholder Report — Stephanie Schoenrock

e President’s Report — Megan Langley
e Approval of minutes from the November meeting and December special meeting

e Treasurer’s Report —
e Review and Approval of November and December Financials

e Staff Production Report

e Old Business
e Building update
e Destination Development Grant — ND Department of Commerce
e ARPA Funding — Ward County
e Tourism Recovery and Resilience Project — Phase 2
e Hotel Tax — City Ordinance

e New Business
e Election of Secretary/Treasurer
e Employee handbook update — insurance coverage
e Budget 2024
e Approved Funding

Next Board Meeting: Wednesday, March 20, 9 am
Location — Sleep Inn



MINOT COMMISSION ON AGING
Board of Directors
MCA Meeting Room — Parker Center
December 15, 2023

PRESENT: Penny Hamilton, Denise Larson, Andrew Maragos, Mary Nester, Steve Podrygula, Tom Probst, Pat Schmitt,
Larry Wahlund, Alan Walter

STAFF: Roger Reich, Val Millen, Deb Leyrer

ABSENT: Lacey McNichols, Bob Schempp, Vicki Summerfield

Vice President Mary Nester called the meeting to order at 12:00 pm.

ANNOUNCEMENTS: None

APPROVAL OF MINUTES: Tom Probst motioned to approve the minutes for November 2023, seconded by Larry
Wahlund; motion carried.

FINANCE REPORT: Val Millen reporting.
e Val Millen presented the October 2023 financials.
* Copies of the 990 and audit were made available to the board as well as copies of the check register.
® Andy Maragos motioned to approve the financials, Steve Podrygula seconded; motion carried.

DIRECTOR’S REPORT: Roger Reich reporting.

e To date, we have no firm condo agreement from the lawyers.
We shut down the Coffee Shop for a week because of illness; we kept the meal program going.
We had 11 seniors join us for the Tour of Lights; this included dinner and then a drive through Oak Park.
Staff delivered over 1300 frozen meals to the rural communities.
Prairie Rose is down to two homemakers, one of which is retiring this month. If we are unable to hire more
staff, we will provide care for private pay clients and also continue to provide SPED meals.

PRESIDENT’S REPORT: None

NEW BUSINESS:
¢ The Nominating Committee brought to the board a possible new Board Member to replace Larry Bellew - Jay
Fisher. Andy motioned to invite Jay Fisher to join our Board, Steve Podrygula seconded; motion carried. Andy
Maragos will reach out to Jay and see if he is interested.
® Mary Nester reported that the Budget Committee met. After questions were answered regarding the budget,
Larry Wahlund made a motion to approve the budget as presented to the Board, Steve Podrygula seconded;
motion carried.

NEXT MEETING: January 19, 2024 in the meeting room.
Meeting was adjourned at 12:25 pm.

Respectfully submitted,

Deb Leyrer Lacey McNichols
Recorder Secretary



MINOT MUNICIPAL COURT
MONTHLY REPORT COMPARISONS FOR JANUARY 2023/2024

TO: CITY MANAGER, HAROLD STEWART
FROM: MINOT MUNICIPAL COURT

JANUARY 2023 JANUARY 2024
MUNICIPAL COURT CASES
FILED 260 401
DISPOSED 280 381
PARKING TICKETS
WRITTEN 138 87
PAID 119 82
REVENUE
FINES & FORFEITURES CASH $ 27,585.93 $ 24,484.88
SUSPENDED FOR JAIL OR CS $ 0.00 $ 0.00
WAIVED $ 2,617.00 $ 6,399.99
DISTRICT COURT TRANSFERS $ 0.00 S 160.00
PARKING TICKETS $ 2,620.00 S 1,720.00
COPY FUND $ 30.00 $ 0.00
FROM POSTED BOND $ 16,924.91 $ 20,299.69
ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE BALANCE $ 656,965.98 $ 717,311.18%*

BALANCE LAST MONTH $703,499.71 (AN INCREASE OF $13,811.47)

COLLECTION AGENCY

TURNED OVER FOR COLLECTION  $ 1,377.25 $  3,690.00
COLLECTED S 2,199.12 $ 375.00
UNCOLLECTABLE S 6,358.39 S ©13.00
ADMIN FEE TO DOM VIOL FUND

FEES PAID S 1,512.97 $ 1,556.20

*Reflects total fees receivables less 80% of total restitution,
which is not owed to the City of Minot (80% = $205,597.54)



Date:
To:

From:
Re:

City of Minots

February 1, 2023

Mayor/City Council

City Manager

City Attorney’s Office

Monthly Attorney Report (February, 2024)

Pursuant to Minot City Code of Ordinances, Section 2-30(7), the following items or issues are
submitted as a summary of some of the matters addressed by the City Attorney’s Office prior to the
February 5, 2023 City Council meeting:

I. Civil Matters

A. Floodplain Eminent Domain Cases:

1. City of Minot v. John Dokken, et al.

Counsel: John Warcup
Opposing Counsel: Bruce Schoenwald
Current Status: Closed at District Court

Settlement Agreement signed, property transfer pending

Following commencement of eminent domain proceedings on this property, the City and
Property Owners reached a resolution whereby the City agreed to purchase of the Dokken
property at the appraised value of $315,000 with the following terms 1) the Dokkens would
be allowed to retain ownership of a shop and shed located on the property by reducing the
purchase price by their salvage cost - $4500 for the shop, and $150 for the shed,
respectively; 2) The Dokkens would be responsible for the cost of moving the shop and
shed; 3) The Dokkens would waive any claim for recovery of attorney fees or costs; and 4)
the Dokkens will continue to have full use and enjoyment of the property, but will be fully
responsible for repairs, maintenance, utilities, taxes, and insurance on the property until
closing, which should occur on or before August 9, 2024.

February: Settlement Agreement is signed, parties are working through the settlement
terms. Closing is set for August 9, 2024.

City of Minot v. Trinity Health, a North Dakota non-profit corporation, et al.

Counsel: John Warcup
Opposing Counsel: David Hogue
Current Status: Closed at District Court

Property acquired, and plat is prepared and will be on the
February 20t City Council meeting consent agenda.

Following commencement of eminent domain proceedings on this property, the City and
Property Owners reached a resolution whereby the City agreed to purchase the Trinity

Page 1 of 7



property for $850,000.00 inclusive of just compensation, damages, attorney fees, and costs.
Staff retained Houston Engineering to prepare a new plat of the property that includes a
metes and bounds description — a requirement of the Ward County Recorder.

February: Property acquired, payment rendered to Trinity. Plat was received from Houston
Engineering and will be on the February 20™ City Council’s consent agenda for minor plat
approval.

City of Minot v. Loyal Order of Moose Minot Lodge #822

Counsel: John Warcup
Opposing Counsel: Jessica Klein
Current Status: Pending in District Court

Jury Trial scheduled for 4/30/2024, 5/1/2024, and 5/2/2024

On May 3, 2021, the City Council commenced eminent domain proceedings relating to a
property owned by Minot Moose Lodge #822. The latest scheduling order in this case
requires the parties to be ready for trial no later than April 1, 2024. A status conference was
held on October 30, 2023. The parties also filed a stipulation to amend the complaint, which
was approved by the Court. Defendants also filed an answer to the amended complaint.

February: Defendant filed an expert witness disclosure disclosing Kevin Ternes as their
expert witness. Also filed is Mr. Ternes’ Appraisal Report. A three jury trial remains on the
District Court calendar for 4/30/2024, 5/1/2024, and 5/2/2024, but negotiations are
ongoing.

B. Other Civil Matters:

1.

2.

Marianne Bender and Doug Bender v. City of Minot

Counsel: Howard Swanson
Appointed by Airport Premises Insurance

Opposing Counsel: Steve Lautt

Current Status: Unfiled

On February 3, 2022, the City was served with a summons and complaint by Plaintiffs. The
complaint alleges the City was negligent in properly maintaining its entry ways at the Minot
International Airport which caused a slip and fall incident to occur on or about February 17,
2019. The airport’s premises insurance (Endurance) appointed Howard Swanson to defend
the City in this lawsuit. Attorney Swanson has served an answer on Plaintiffs.

February: Discovery and negotiations are ongoing.

City of Minot v. Cypress Development, LLC

Counsel: Jocelyn Knoll and Kate Johnson
Dorsey & Whitney
Appointed by City Council/NDIRF

Opposing Counsel: Attorneys from Schwabe, Williamson & Wyatt P.C.

Page 2 of 7



Current Status: Closed at District Court, Judgment

This matter relates to the construction of two city-owned parking structures on City lots,
plus retail or office space and residential units on top of the parking ramps. A private
developer, Cypress Development, LLC, was to manage the City’s parking structures and
develop the residential units and commercial improvements. Several agreements exist,
including, but not necessarily limited to, 2015 Lease Agreements, 2015 Management
Agreement, 2013 Development Agreement, and a Development and Disposition Agreement.
Cypress failed to pay amounts owed to the City as rent and then, upon notice of its material
breach, failed to cure its breach within the 120-day period. Cypress failed to properly
manage the parking structures. Cypress failed to pay all costs for the development and
construction of the Parking Structures in excess of the City’s obligation. Because Cypress
failed to maintain a lease, due to its failure to pay the rent, Cypress also violated the
Development and Disposition Agreement. On March 15, 2018, the City served a summons
and complaint on Cypress. Ultimately, a jury trial occurred and the jury returned a verdict
in favor of the City. The jury determined that Cypress Development breached its contracts
with the City; in addition, the jury determined that the City was entitled to damages in the
amount of $2,442,479.94. Cypress’s countersuit, which sought more than $50 million in
damages, was denied by the jury in its entirety.

Cypress filed a motion for a new trial alleging juror misconduct, which was denied by the
District Court. The City served a notice of entry of judgment. Thus far, the City received
$330,000.00 in exchange for a partial release of the judgment lien to allow for a sale of
property within the City. The money is considered program income under CDBG Allocation
1. The City is still able to pursue collection efforts for the remaining amount owed pursuant
to the judgment.

February: An executive session for attorney consultation was held on January 16, 2024.
Post judgment collection efforts are ongoing. City Attorney will remove this matter from the
monthly report and will update the City Council on any further opportunities to enforce the
judgment.

. Todd Mickelson v. City of Minot

Counsel: Brian Schmidt
Appointed by NDIRF

Opposing Counsel: Leo Wilking

Current Status: Pending in District Court
Scheduling Order states parties should be ready for trial by
October 1, 2024.

On May 26, 2023, the City was served with a summons and complaint by the Plaintiff. The
complaint alleges the Plaintiff's employment as a city employee was terminated as a result
of retaliation. The North Dakota Insurance Reserve Fund (NDIRF) appointed Brian Schmidt
to defend the City in this lawsuit. Complaint was filed in District Court on June 8, 2023.
City’s Answer was filed on June 16, 2023. An Alternative Dispute Resolution Statement was
filed by the City on August 15, 2023.

February: Discovery is ongoing, Depositions of present and former city employees were

conducted on January 22-23, 2023. Scheduling order states parties agree to be ready for
trial by October 1, 2024.

Page 3 of 7



4. Citizen’s Alley Appeal (RMM Properties, L.L.L.P.)

Counsel: Bryan Van Grinsven
Appointed by NDIRF

Opposing Counsel: Nici Meyer and Ryan Quarne

Current Status: Briefs filed, Matter is pending in District Court

On October 17, 2023, RMM Properties, L.L.L.P filed a Notice of Appeal with the North Central
Judicial District alleging the City of Minot applied the incorrect legal standard when approving
an application for vacation of a plat, and approval of a new preliminary plat, and in doing so
the action constitutes a taking of real property without compensation. NDIRF has appointed
attorney Bryan Van Grinsven to represent the City in response to the appeal. The filed its
Certificate of Record with District Court on November 13, 2023. The Court issued a briefing
schedule on November 15, 2023 requiring the RMM Properties, L.L.L.P. to submit its
appellate brief on or before December 6, 2023, and the City to submit its appellee brief
within 10 days of service of the appellate brief. The City supplemented its records with links
to the Planning Commission and City Council meetings regarding this matter on November
28, 2023.

February: RMM Properties, L.L.L.P. filed a reply brief and the matter is pending before the
District Court.

5. Nathan Properties, LLC Appeal

Counsel: John Warcup
Appointed by NDIRF

Opposing Counsel: Jessica Lee Klein

Current Status: Notice of Appeal served on the City and filed in District Court
on January 26, 2024. City is preparing a response and
certified record.

On January 26, 2024, Nathan Properties, LLC filed a Notice of Appeal with the District Court
seekng judicial review of a denial of relocation benefits.

Nathan Properties, LLC was denied relocation benefits because the NDR Program Manager
determined that they were ineligible pursuant to 49 CFR Part 24.305(b), which determines
eligibility when one or more displaced entities could be considered a single business, entitled
to only one fixed payment. Nathan Properties, LLC shared the same premises as Minot
Welding, Inc., which also applied for and received relocation benefits. The same person
owns, controls, and manages the affairs of the two entities. The relocation benefits rendered
to Minot Welding, Inc. contemplated moving everything in the building that Minot Welding,
Inc. allegedly shared with Nathan Properties, LLC and there is no personal property left in
the building. Given these facts and others, the NDR Program Manager determined that
Nathan Properties, LLC's request for relocation services should be denied.

C. City Business:

1. MAGIC Fund Guidelines - The City Manager and MACEDC President/CEO presented
proposed changes to the MAGIC Fund Guidelines to the City Council on November 20, 2023.
The City Attorney amended the draft guidelines to incorporate City Council input and
circulated them amongst City staff and MACEDC staff/counsel on November 21, 2023. These

Page 4 of 7




were approved by the City Council at their meeting on December 4, 2023, and the guidelines
are being finalized for publication on the City website.

. City Department Legal Support - This Office provided legal support to the City’s City

Manager, Department Heads, and Planning Commission regarding contracts, human
resources/personnel issues, and other legal matters, including the following:

b.

ADP Training: The City Attorney’s Office staff has been completing training and
evaluations on the City’s new ADP software.

Superfund Site Meetings/Document Review: The City Attorney and Assistant
Attorney Schmitz have been attending meetings with the Utilities Director, State
Department of Environmental Quality, Environmental Protection Agency and Park
District regarding the old Minot landfill superfund site and amending the operations
and maintenance plan to allow the park district to use the site.

Park Fee Collection Process Update: Assistant City Attorney Schmitz met with
Community Development and Planning staff to discuss amendments to the Land
Development Ordinances to allow the Minot Park District to collect and process fees
themselves, rather than the City collecting their fees and distributing the same.
Alleyway Speed Limit Ordinance: Assistant City Attorney Schmitz is continuing
work on a proposed alleyway speed limit ordinance.

Civil Service Hearing: The City Attorney, HR Department, and Engineering staff
participated in a civil service hearing on Friday, January 18 concerning an appeal of
a PIP and Letter of Repremand. The Civil Service Commission upheld the PIP and had
the Letter of Repremand removed from the file because the details in the letter were
also in the PIP.

Project BEE/Broadway Circle Project: The City Attorney and Assistant City
Attorney Dickerson drafted a mutual termination agreement, purchase agreement,
bill of sale, and other termination documents and reviewed the same with City staff
and other interested parties.

Travis Stewart Restitution Claim: The City Manager and Community and
Economic Development Director forwarded the City Attorney’s Office correspondence
from a resident claiming the City owes him restitution for conducting abatement
efforts on his property. Assistant City Attorney Schmitz is reviewing the file to confirm
all appropriate steps were taken.

Airport Emergency Fuel Pump Purchase: The City Attorney and Assistant City
Attorney Dickerson met and conferred with Airport and Finance staff regarding the
emergency purchase of a fuel pump.

NAWS Finance Agreement: Assistant City Attorney Schmitz reviewed and provided
comment on a NAWS Financing Agreement to Utilities Director Sorenson.

CDBG Services Agreement: Assistant City Attorney Dickerson is working with NDR
Program Director Plank on edits to a service agreement with Resource Consultants.
Easement Agreements: Assistant City Attorney Schmitz is presently reviewing
draft easement documents with Project Manager Ben Cofell.

Depositions: City Attorney Stalheim attended some of the staff depositions in the
civil case concerning Todd Mickelson

Development Agreement: Assistant City Attorney Schmitz and City Attorney
Stalheim are reviewing a development agreement for Highalander 5% Subdivision &
55% Crossing 9t Addition with the Planning Department.

Big M/Tracks TIF Agreement Progress: The City Attorney reviewed and
discussed progress on the BIG M/Tracks TIF Agreements with City staff and external
stakeholders.

Edgewood Real Estate Investment Trust Development Agreement: The City
Attorney has confirmed attorney Kate Johnson is interested in assisting with this
project pending a conflict check. Ms. Johnson indicated that she will likely pull in her
partner Jay Lindgren, to participate in the drafting of this agreement. Mr. Lindgren is

Page 5 of 7




II.

licensed to practice law in North Dakota and has extensive experience in agreements
of this nature.

3. Ordinance/Policy Revisions:

a. Alcohol Ordinance Ad Hoc Committee: The City Attorney has attended two
meetings of the Alcohol Ordinance Ad Hoc Committee, and she and the City Clerk will
be preparing some draft ordinances for the committee’s consideration.

b. Fire Inspection Fees: The City Attorney and Assistant City Attorney Dickerson
assisted the Fire Chief with drafting an ordinance imposing fire inspection fees and
an accompanying resolution.

c. Emergency Action Plan Meeting: The City Attorney attended an emergency action
plan meeting with other Department Heads to discuss updates.

. City Manager Committees: Assistant City Attorney Dickerson has been serving on the

Employee Recognition Committee.

. Assistant City Attorney Portfolios: The City Attorney’s Office has created portfolios for

each of the attorneys in an effort to streamline inquiries from City Departments and Officials.
Current portfolio assignments are:

a. Stefanie Stalheim: City Council, City Manager, Human Resources, Finance/NDR-
CDBG, Assessors, Library

b. Nick Schmitz: Municipal Court, Engineering, Public Works, Community and
Economic Development, Planning Commission

C. Corbin Dickerson: Municipal Court, Police, Fire, Airport

While all city attorneys are available to City staff and officials for consultation, it is our hope
that the portfolio system will allow our attorneys to develop an expertise within their
assigned portfolios, and in turn increase response time and provide more specialized
services.

Criminal Matters

. Minot Municipal Court - Assistant City Attorneys handled routine and daily matters in

Minot Municipal Court for criminal prosecution (trials) and civil ordinance violations, as well
as approval or initiation of criminal complaints for ordinance violations.

a. Annual Case Totals: Below is a table of documenting the number of criminal and
traffic matters opened in municipal court each month for 2022, 2023, and now 2024:

2022 Criminal | Traffic | Total 2023 Criminal | Traffic | Total
January 94 208 302 January 83 177 260
February 91 269 360 February 84 208 292
March 75 321 396 March 121 256 377
April 104 209 313 April 154 361 515
May 114 345 459 May 145 318 463
June 114 324 438 June 119 357 476
July 92 235 327 July 170 404 574
August 134 241 375 August 147 372 519
September 118 217 335 September 112 260 372
October 75 200 275 October 124 310 434
November 91 138 229 November 155 250 405

Page 6 of 7



December 79 151 230 December 140 274 414

totals 1181 2858 | 4039 totals 1554 3547 | 5101
%o
2022 2023 change
o 2024 Criminal | Traffic | Total
Criminal 1181 1554 32%
¢ »858 3 240 January 141 260 401
T i 47 4%
ramic 85 2 > totals 141 260 | 401
4039 5101 26%

B. District Court - Assistant City Attorneys attended and responded to the scheduling of
District Court transfer cases involving initial appearances, motion responses, motion
hearings, status conferences, pretrial conferences, and order to show cause proceedings for
criminal cases originating in the Minot Municipal Court and subsequently transferred to the
Ward County District Court.

Respectfully Submitted,

m Recoverable Signature

Stefanie Stalheim
City Attorney
Signed by: 48ae2bc4-fd85-4c0e-alea-7c87bc0c1a31

Page 7 of 7



On January 16, 2024, a Regular Meeting of the Minot City Council was held in the Council Chambers at City Hall. Mayor
Ross called the meeting to order at 5:30 pm.

ROLL CALL
Members Present:
Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner, Podrygula, Ross
Members Absent:
Evans
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Mayor Ross led the City Council in the Pledge of Allegiance.

MAYOR’S REPORT

Mayor Ross attended the opening of the Children’s Library at MPL, community project meetings, an MACEDC meeting, a Visit
Minot meeting, provided a media interview, and did a welcoming at Marketplace for Kids at MSU. Mayor Ross asked the City
Council if there were any objections to add action item 7.5 Conditional Approval of Alcohol Beverage License. There were no
objections from council. Mayor Ross also mentioned items 7.2 & 7.3 were going to be combined for discussion purposes. There
were no objections from council.

CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

Harold Stewart submitted a written report to the council. Harold Stewart and Jennifer Eckman, the Airport Director, also discussed
some of the issues the Airport has been working through from the prior weekend.

5.1 PUBLIC HEARING: RENAISSANCE ZONE FINAL APPROVAL ON PROJECT M-83 BY ALEX AND NIKI BEACH
ON PROPERTY LOCATED AT 501 MAIN STREET SOUTH

Alderman Jantzer moved the City Council close the public hearing and approve this project and authorize staff to advance it to the
State of North Dakota for final approval.

Motion seconded by Alderman Pitner and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner, Podrygula,
Ross; nays: none.

CONSENT ITEMS

Alderwoman Olson moved the City Council approve consent items 6.1-6.2 #3 and 6.3-6.16.

6.1 CITY COUNCIL MINUTES - Approve the minutes from the December 22, 2023, Special City Council meeting, the January 2,
2024, Regular City Council meeting, and the January 10, 2024, Special City Council meeting.

6.2 ORDINANCES - Approval of the following ordinances considered for second reading:

1. Ordinance No 5934 - Annexation of Lot 1, Dawn to Dusk Addition

2. Ordinance No 5935 - Airport Rules and Standards Ordinance

3. Ordinance No 5936 - 2024 BA - NDDOT State Planning & Research Grant
(Ordinances are available for inspection and copying at the City Hall City Clerk’s Office during normal office hours (generally Mon-
Friday 8:00am — 4:30pm))

6.3 ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVALS - Approve the following administrative approvals.
1. Minot Majettes Dance Team Booster to conduct a raffle on January 20, 2024 at Magic City Campus (1100 11th Ave
SW).
2. Power of 1 to conduct a raffle on May 1, 2024 at ARCO (1520 24th Ave SW).
3. MCDC Booster Club to conduct a raffle on January 7, 2024 at Ann Nicole Nelson Hall (500 University Ave W).
4. Boy Scout Troop 425 to conduct a raffle on March 16, 2024 at the Congregational United Church of Christ (430 N
Broadway).
5. Special Event Permit for Whiskey Nine, LLC dba Whiskey Nine (111 W Central Ave).
6. Two Special Event Permits for Sports on Tap, Inc. dba Sports on Tap (220 S Broadway).

Page 1 of 4



6.4 MAYORAL APPOINTMENTS - Confirm the following appointments:
e Amy Rogers to replace Jen Cook on the Renaissance Zone Review Board, with a term to expire December of 2025.
e  Kevin Black to replace Adam Hoffman on the Alcohol Ordinance Review and Rewrite Committee.

6.5 FINAL APPROVAL OF MAGIC FUND GUIDELINES - Approve the final draft of the MAGIC Fund guidelines.

6.6 MAJOR SUBDIVISION FINAL PLAT: ROSEHILL CEMETERY FOURTH ADDITION - Approve a major subdivision final
plat for Rosehill Cemetery Fourth Addition in alignment with the Planning Commission recommendation.

6.7 APPROVAL OF 2023 INTEREST DISTRIBUTION - Approve the 2023 interest distribution.

6.8 MINOT AIR FORCE BASE WATER RATE CONTRACT AMENDMENT - Approve the ratification of the Finance Director for
signing the Minot Air Force Base (MAFB) water rate contract amendment. The amendment is pertaining to the water rates for the Air
Force Base and was effective January 1, 2024.

6.9 FIRE STATION 5 — FINAL PAYMENT (FD0024) - Approve the retainage payment to Roers in the amount of $12,000.00.

6.10 WARD COUNTY MOU FOR CORONER SERVICES - Authorize the Fire and Police Chief to sign the MOU with Ward
County for coroner services.

6.11 WARD COUNTY HAZARD MITIGATION PLAN ANNUAL PROGRESS REPORT - Receive and file the Hazard Mitigation
Plan Annual Progress Report.

6.12 2024 USGS MONITORING AGREEMENT (4578.3) - Approve the standard joint funding agreement with the USGS for
operation of two (2) water quality gauges on the Souris River; and authorize the Mayor and Public Works Director to sign the
agreement.

6.13 NEW LANDFILL ENTRANCE - FINAL PAYMENT (4580) - Approve the final payment amount of $9,556.85 to Farden
Construction, Inc. for the New Landfill Entrance project.

6.14 APPROVE THE EXTENSION TO THE SUBRECIPIENT AGREEMENT BETWEEN CITY OF MINOT AND THE MINOT
HOUSING AUTHORITY - Approve the Fourth Amendment to the Subrecipient Agreement between the City of Minot and the
Minot Housing Authority extending the period of performance to March 1, 2024, except for those activities required for closeout.

6.15 ACCEPTANCE OF LAW ENFORCEMENT RESILIENCY GRANT - Accept the law enforcement resiliency grant; approve
the proposed ordinance on the first reading; and authorize the Mayor, Finance Director, and project director to sign the grant award.

6.16 FACADE IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM FOR JORDAN ROSS AND MEGAN ROSS LOCATED AT 23 2ND AVE SE -
Approve a forgivable loan application FI-11 for Jordan Ross and Megan Ross for a property located at 23 2nd Ave. SE in an amount
not to exceed $125,362.00, subject to conditions of the program.

Motion seconded by Alderman Pitner and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner, Podrygula,
Ross; nays: none.

6.2 #4 HUMAN RELATIONS COMMITTEE (REPEAL) — APPROVED

Alderman Podrygula moved the City Council approve Ordinance No 5937 Human Relations Committee Repeal on second reading.

Motion seconded by Alderman Jantzer and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Ross; nays:
Pitner, Podrygula.

ACTION ITEMS

7.1 CHAPTER 13 CITY ORDINANCE UPDATES AND FIRE INSPECTION FEES - APPROVED

Alderman Pitner moved the City Council approve the proposed ordinance on first reading; and review and consider the draft
resolution setting fire inspection fees.

Motion seconded by Alderman Jantzer and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner,
Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

Page 2 of 4



7.2 TRANSIT CENTER APPROVE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND 1ST STREET SW TRAFFIC REVISIONS
(4171) & 7.3 DOWNTOWN PARKING GARAGE RFP PROPOSALS — APPROVED

Alderman Pitner moved the City Council accept the proposals, the recommendations of the review committee, and direct staff to
proceed with negotiating a development agreement with Edgewood Real Estate Investment Trust to develop the Central Garage
(Project 2-2023) with the following friendly amendments:

e  Acquire outside counsel to review the contract; and
e  Complete a PFM Group Cost/Benefit Analysis.

Motion seconded by Alderwoman Olson and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner,
Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

Alderwoman Olson moved the City Council approve plans and specifications and authorize a call for bids for the transit center; and
pass the following parking related ordinances due to the Minot Transit Center relocation:

Restrict parking on the west side of 1st Street SW between Burdick Expwy W and 3rd Avenue SW

Restrict parking on the west side of 1st Street SW between 3rd Avenue SW and 2nd Avenue SW

Restrict parking on the west side of 1st Street SW for 210-feet north of 2nd Avenue SW

Restrict parking to transit vehicles only for the east side of 1st Street SW between 3rd Avenue SW and 2nd Avenue SW

2o ow

Motion seconded by Alderman Podrygula and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Podrygula,
Ross; nays: Pitner. The council members also suggested signage for publicly accessible restrooms not only at the transit center, but
also on the North entrance to City Hall.

7.4 EXTEND MAGIC FUND GRANT TO SOURIS BASIN PLANNING COUNCIL TO FUND THE BUSINESS
ACCELERATOR FUND — APPROVED

Alderwoman Olson moved the City Council approve staff to draft an amendment to extend the agreement with Souris Basin Planning
Council to fund the Business Accelerator Fund until June 30, 2024; and authorize the Mayor and Clerk to sign the agreement.

Motion seconded by Alderman Jantzer and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner,
Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

7.5 ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE LICENSE — APPROVED
Alderman Pitner moved the City Council conditionally approve 28 Tastes & Taps pending departmental approval.

Motion seconded by Alderwoman Olson and carried by the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner,
Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

PERSONAL APPEARANCES

Billi Gunderson addressed the council about ADA accessibility. Lisa Hermosillo talked to the City Council about a new mental
health support group called Talk United Minot. Scott Samuelson discussed the downtown parking garage project, Economic
Development, and property tax.

MISCELLANEOUS AND DISCUSSION ITEMS

David Lakefield mentioned the City of Minot was just awarded the Achievement of Excellence and Reporting for the 44t
consecutive year.

9.1 MACEDC BIANNUAL PRESENTATION
Brekka Kramer presented the MACEDC biannual presentation to the City Council.

9.2 HOUSING STUDY UPDATE

Tom Leighton presented to the City Council the Minot Housing Needs and Market Study.
LIAISON REPORTS

Page 30f4



Alderman Burlingame and Alderman Podrygula had no meetings to report. Alderman Jantzer and Alderwoman Olson mention the
upcoming Liaison meeting and Central Dakota MPO meeting. Alderman Pitner attended the Renaissance Zone Review Board
meeting and a Visit Minot meeting.

ADJOURNMENT

There being no further business, Alderman Pitner moved the City Council meeting be adjourned. Motion seconded by Alderwoman
Olson and carried unanimously. Meeting adjourned at 8:25 pm.

For the full January 16, 2024 Regular City Council meeting video, see: Minot City Council Meeting 1/16/24 - YouTube.

ATTEST: APPROVED:
Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk Thomas Ross, Mayor

Page 4 of 4


https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=34bRcNCLmgk

On January 16, 2024, a Special Meeting of the Minot City Council was held in the Council Chambers at City Hall. Mayor
Ross called the meeting to order at 4:30 pm.

ROLL CALL

Members Present:
Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner, Podrygula, Ross
Members Absent:
Evans
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Mayor Ross presiding and led the City Council in the Pledge of Allegiance.

EXECUTIVE SESSION: CITY OF MINOT VS CYPRESS DEVELOPMENT, LLC — ATTORNEY CONSULATION

Mayor Ross stated the next item on the agenda is an executive session for attorney consultation regarding Ward County Case No.
51-2018-CV-00518, City of Minot v. Cypress Development. The legal authority for closing this portion of the meeting is North
Dakota Century Code Section 44-04-19.1.

The topic or purpose of the executive session is to allow time for the City Council to seek and receive their attorney’s advice and
guidance on the legal risks, strengths, and weaknesses of an action of a public entity, which, if held in public, would have an
adverse fiscal effect on the entity. At this time, a motion would be in order to discuss agenda item number 3 in executive session.

Whereupon, Alderman Podrygula motioned the City Council move into an executive session. Motion seconded by Alderman
Pitner, and carried the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson, Pitner, Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

The executive session will be recorded and all members of the Council are reminded to limit their discussion during the executive
session to the announced topic. Any collective decision, collective commitment, or other final action by the Council will occur
after it reconvenes in an open meeting, unless final action is specifically required by law to be taken during the executive session.
The prohibition on taking final action during the executive session does not apply to providing guidance or instructions to our
attorney or negotiators.

At this time the Council will relocate to the City Council conference room adjoining Council Chambers. During the executive
session, members of the public attending the meeting are welcome remain in Council Chambers. We anticipate adjourning the
executive session, and returning to the dais to reconvene the open portion of this meeting, at approximately 5:15 pm.

The executive session began at 4:34 pm and was attended by all members of the City Council, as well as the Mayor, City Clerk,
City Attorney, Assistant City Manager, City Manager, Finance Director, and the Communication and Engagement Manager.

At 5:12 pm, Alderman Pitner moved the City Council adjourn the executive session and return to the regular City Council
meeting. Motion seconded by Alderman Burlingame, and carried the following roll call vote: ayes: Burlingame, Jantzer, Olson,
Pitner, Podrygula, Ross; nays: none.

ADJOURNMENT

There being no further business, Alderman Pitner moved the City Council meeting be adjourned. Motion seconded
by Alderman Jantzer and carried unanimously. The meeting adjourned at 5:14 pm.

ATTEST: APPROVED:
Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk Thomas Ross, Mayor

Page 1 of 1



ORDINANCE NO: 5938

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE 2024 ANNUAL BUDGET TO INCREASE THE
POLICE GRANT DEPARTMENT REVENUES AND EXPENDITURES FOR THE LAW
ENFORCEMENT RESILIENCY GRANT AWARD.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MINOT:

§1: An ordinance amending the 2024 annual budget to increase the Police
Grant department revenues and expenditures for the Law Enforcement
Resiliency Grant award:

10000000-33400 | 2024200008 $48,750
10020000-45800 | 2024200008 11,375
10020000-45900 | 2024200008 2,375
10020000-43300 | 2024200008 35,000

8§2: This ordinance shall be in effect from and after its passage and

approval.

PASSED FIRST READING:

PASSED SECOND READING:

ATTEST:

Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk

January 16, 2024

February 5, 2024

APPROVED:

Thomas Ross, Mayor



ORDINANCE NO. 5939

AN ORDINANCE ADDING TO THE LIST OF CITY COUNCIL CREATED TRAFFIC RESTRICTIONS PROVIDED FOR IN
CHAPTER 20, ARTICLE 1, SECTION 20-2 OF THE CITY OF MINOT CODE OF ORDINANCES.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MINOT:

Section 1. The following described zone is hereby added to the list of City Council created traffic restrictions
provided for in SECTION 20-2 (a) (3): NO PARKING ZONES

1. West side of 1%t Street SW between 3" Avenue SW and Burdick Expressway W
2. West side of 1%t Street SW between 2" Avenue SW and 3@ Avenue SW
3. West side of 1%t Street SW for 210-feet north from the center of the 2" Avenue SW intersection.

Section 2. The following described zone is hereby added to the list of City Council created traffic restrictions
provided for in SECTION 20-2 (a) (6): PARKING AND LOADING ZONES

1. Transit Only parking on the east side of 1% Street SW between 2" Avenue SW and 3™ Avenue SW

Section 3. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its approval, passage and proper sign
posting.

Section 4. Penalty Clause: The penalty for any violation of the provisions of the ordinance shall be in accordance
with Section 1-8 of the City of Minot Code of Ordinances.

PASSED FIRST READING: January 16, 2024
PASSED SECOND READING: February 5, 2024

APPROVED:

Thomas Ross, Mayor
ATTEST:

Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk



City of Minots

ORDINANCE NO. 5940

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REENACTING CHAPTER 13 (FIRE PREVENTION
AND PROTECTION) CODE OF ORDINANCES, CITY OF MINOT, NORTH DAKOTA TO
ALLOW THE CITY COUNCIL TO ESTABLISH FIRE PERMIT, LICENSE, AND INSPECTION
FEES BY RESOLUTION.

WHEREAS, the City of Minot is a political subdivision lawfully recognized in the state of North
Dakota as a home rule city and possessing municipal powers and authority pursuant to its
home rule charter and the provision of North Dakota Century Code (NDCC) § 40-05.1, as well
as statutory provisions codified in NDCC 40-05-01; and

WHEREAS, the City of Minot has the authority, through its home rule charter, to adopt,
amend, and repeal ordinances, resolutions, and regulations to carry out its governmental and
proprietary powers and to provide for public health, safety, morals, and welfare, and penalties
for a violation thereof, including the power to fix fees in the exercise of its governmental
police powers; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to set fees for fire code permits, licenses, and compliance
inspections by resolution; and

WHEREAS, the City Council further desires to grant its fire chief or their designee the power
to charge fees for fire code permits, licenses, and compliance inspections; and

WHEREAS, the City Council further desires to amend the existing Chapter 13, Code of
Ordinances, to rectify clerical errors, update, modernize, and remove outdated language and
bring the existing ordinance into alignment with current practices; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
MINOT:

81 CHAPTER 13 (FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION) CODE OF ORDINANCES,
CITY OF MINOT, NORTH DAKOTA, is hereby repealed and reenacted as follows:

Chapter 13 FIRE PREVENTION AND PROTECTION
ARTICLE I. IN GENERAL

Sec. 13-1. Careless smoking; notice in hotel rooms.

(a) It shall be unlawful for any person, in a careless, negligent or reckless
manner, while smoking or attempting to light or smoke tobacco to set fire
to any building, furniture, curtains, drapes, house or household fittings or
furnishings in any hotel, public rooming house, tenement house, or public
building.

(b) A plainly printed notice shall be posted in a conspicuous place in each
sleeping room of all hotels, public rooming houses, lodging houses and



other places of public assemblage within the city advising tenants of the
provisions of this section.
Sec. 13-2. Fire to be reported immediately.
Every fire occurring in or about any building within the city shall be reported
immediately to the fire department.
Secs. 13-3, 13-4. Reserved.

Editor's note(s)—Sections 13-3, 13-4 and 13-6, derived from Rev. Gen. Ords.
1962, §§ 8-0103, 12-0109 and 12-0111, were repealed by Ord. No. 2443, § 2,
adopted June 15, 1981. Said sections prohibited the taking of fire department
property, required that permission be obtained to enter or occupy rooms used
by the fire department, and dealt with the use and sale of fireworks.

Sec. 13-5. Obstructing firefighter.

It shall be unlawful to obstruct any firefighter in the performance of their duties.

Sec. 13-6. Reserved.

Note(s)—See the editor's note to § 13-3.

Secs. 13-7—13-16. Reserved.

ARTICLE II. FIRE DEPARTMENT
DIVISION 1. GENERALLY

Sec. 13-17. Composition; eligible persons.

The fire department shall consist of a fire chief and as many firefighters as the
city council determines to be adequate. The fire chief and firefighters shall be
appointed by the city manager pursuant to Chapter 24 of the Code of
Ordinances.

Sec. 13-18. Firefighters to comply with rules and regulations.

Firefighters shall strictly comply with all rules and regulations of the fire
department, and shall promptly and implicitly obey all orders given by the fire
chief or acting fire chief.

Sec. 13-19. Members to have certain powers of police.

All members of the fire department shall have, while on active duty, the same
powers as police officers while on duty, and are authorized to arrest any person
who interferes or attempts to interfere with, or hinders or attempts to hinder
any member of the fire department in the performance of their duty.



Sec. 13-20. Police force to assist fire department.

Any member of the police department, when requested by the city manager or
fire chief, shall report to all fires and assist in extinguishing the fire, protect
property, preserve order and lend their aid and assistance in any useful manner
directed by the official in command.

Sec. 13-21. When awards may be accepted.

Any member of the fire department may, with the consent of the city council
and not otherwise, receive and retain any present or reward tendered to them
for meritorious service in the discharge of their duty.

Secs. 13-22—13-27. Reserved.
DIVISION 2. FIRE CHIEF

Sec. 13-28. Powers and duties of fire chief.

The duties and powers of the fire chief are as follows:

(@) To make monthly and other reports. The fire chief shall make written
reports at the end of each month, and more often when required to do
so by the city manager. The report shall be filed in the office of the city
manager. The city manager shall present the report of the fire chief.

(b) Responsibility for equipment. The fire chief shall have charge of, and be
responsible for, all fire equipment and see that it is kept in repair, in
efficient working order and ready for instant use. The fire chief shall
promptly report to the city manager any serious injuries to or defects in
any of the fire apparatus belonging to the city.

(©) Prescribe rules and regulations. The fire chief shall prescribe such rules
and regulations for the operation of the department as are in their
judgment necessary to secure the best and most efficient service.

(d) Assign firefighters. The fire chief shall assign firefighters to such
positions in the department as they are best qualified to fill, subject to
approval of the city manager.

(e) Investigate fires. The fire chief shall immediately after each fire carefully
and thoroughly investigate the cause of the fire, and may call the police
department for assistance.

) Control and enforce discipline. The fire chief under the direction of the
city manager shall have absolute control and command over all persons
connected with the fire department and shall possess full power and
authority to enforce discipline in the department.

(g) Prescribe limits at fire. The fire chief may prescribe limits in the vicinity
of any fire within which no person shall be permitted to enter except
those who reside therein, firefighters, police officers, and those admitted
by the fire chief’s order.

(h) May order removal of property. At all fires, the fire chief shall have the
power to remove any property if it becomes necessary for the



0

@

(k)

preservation of the property, to prevent the spreading of fire, or to
protect adjoining property.

Authority at fires. The fire chief shall have absolute command at fires.
In the absence of the fire chief, the assistant chief officer shall have
command. All members of the fire department and bystanders shall
observe and obey the directions and orders of the officer in command.

May require assistance. The fire chief shall have power to command such
assistance from persons attending any fire, not members of the fire
department, for the extinguishment of fires and the preservation of
property exposed to fire as may in the fire chief’s judgment be required.

Charge inspection fees. The Fire Chief or their designee shall charge
fees as established by the City Council for fire permits, licenses, and
code compliance inspections, except when such building or premises is
owned by state or local government. It shall be the duty of every person
maintaining or operating a business or premises to pay the inspection
fees.

Secs. 13-29—13-38. Reserved.

ARTICLE III. FIRE CODE

Sec. 13-39. International Fire Code adopted.

@

(b)

The International Fire Code, 2018 Edition (published by the
International Code Council Inc.), is by reference thereto incorporated
herein as fully as though set out at length hereafter (except and to the
extent that the provisions there of are deleted, modified or amended in
section 13-40 and section 13-41 below). References in the Code of
Ordinances to the fire code shall mean the fire code adopted hereby.
Notwithstanding anything to the contrary therein, the fire code may be
referred as:

(@D) "the International Fire Code, 2018 Edition";
2 "the Fire Code of the City of Minot, ND";
(3)  "the IFC";

“4) "the fire prevention code";

(5) "the fire code"; or

(6) "this code".

One (1) copy of the IFC shall be maintained at all times in the office of
the city clerk for public inspections. 13-40. Amendments to the fire
code.

The IFC referred to in section 13-39 is amended as provided in the following
subsections.

1)

)

IFC 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the
City of Minot, ND, hereinafter referred to as "their code."

IFC 102.4 is amended to read as follows:



3)

“
()

(6)
)
)
€C))

(10)
11
12)

13)
14)

102.4 Application of Building Code. The design and construction of
new structures shall comply with the International Building Code as
amended by the State of North Dakota. And any alterations, additions,
changes in use or changes in structures required by their code which
are within the scope of the International Building Code as amended by
the State of North Dakota shall be made in accordance therewith.

IFC 104.9 is amended to read as follows:

104.9 Alternative materials and methods. Appeals regarding the
suitability of alternate materials, types of construction, or code
interpretation shall be made as established under section 9-2(6) of the
City of Minot Code of Ordinances.

IFC 105.6.1 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.8 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 105.6.8 An operational permit is required for carbon dioxide
systems used in beverage dispensing applications having more than 500
pounds of Carbon Dioxide.

IFC 105.6.10 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.14 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.20 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.23 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 105.6.23 Hot work operations.
An operational permit is required for hot work including, but not
limited to:

1. Use of portable hot work equipment inside a structure. Exception:
Work that is conducted under a construction permit.

2. Fixed-site hot work equipment, such as welding booths.

3. Hot work conducted within a wildfire risk area.

4. Where approved, the fire code official shall issue a permit to carry

out a hot work program. Their program allows approved
personnel to regulate their facility's hot work operations. The
approved personnel shall be trained in the fire safety aspects
denoted in their chapter and shall be responsible for issuing
permits requiring compliance with the requirements found in
chapter 34. These permits shall be issued only to their employees
or hot work operations under their supervision.

IFC 105.6.29 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.30 is deleted.
IFC 105.6.43 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 105.6.43 Repair garages. An operational permit is required for
operation of repair garages.

IFC 105.7, inclusive of IFC 105.7.1 through IFC 105.7.25, are deleted.

IFC 110.4 is amended to read as follows (although IFC 110.4.1 shall
remain as provided in the 2018 IFC):



(15)

(16)

an

IFC 110.4 Violations penalties. Persons shall not violate any
provision of their code; fail to comply with any of the requirements
thereof; or erect, install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,
or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of their code.
Violations shall be punishable pursuant to section 1-8 of the City of
Minot Code of Ordinances. Each violation shall constitute a separate
violation. Each day any person violates any provision of their code
shall constitute a separate offense.

IFC 110.5 is enacted to read as follows:

IFC 110.5 Remedies cumulative.

The remedies provided for in their code shall be considered cumulative
to, or alternative to, the remedies set forth in chapter 9, or chapter
22, or both, of the Code of Ordinances.

IFC 112.4 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 112.4 Failure to Comply.

No person shall continue any work after having been served with a
stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition. A violation of their
provision shall be punishable pursuant to section 1-8 of the City of
Minot Code of Ordinances. Each day any person violates any provision
of their code shall constitute a separate offense.

IFC 202 General Definitions. The following definitions are amended to
read as follows:

Commercial Motor Vehicle. A motor vehicle used to transport
passengers or property or motorized equipment where the motor
vehicle or equipment:

1. Has a gross vehicle weight of 10,000 pounds (454kg) or more;
or

2. Has a combined fleet weight of 26,000 pounds or more; or

3. Is designed to transport 16 or more passengers, including the
driver.

Group E, day care facilities. Their group includes buildings and
structures or portions thereof occupied by more than 18 children older
than 2V2 years of age who receive educational, supervision or personal
care services for less than 24 hours a day.

Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3 occupancies where the
occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as
Group R-1, R-2, or R-4 or |, including:
Boarding houses (non-transient) with 16 or fewer occupants
Building that do not contain more than two dwelling units.

Child care facilities that provide accommodations for eighteen
or few[er] persons of any age for less than 24 hours.

Congregate living facilities (non-transient) with 16 or fewer
occupants



(18)

19

(20)

(21)

(22)

Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer
occupants

Lodging houses with five or fewer guest|[s].
IFC 308.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 308.1.4 Open flame cooking devices. Charcoal burners and
other open-flame cooking devices shall not be operated on
combustible balconies or decks or within 10 feet of combustible
construction.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings

2. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water
capacity not greater than 47.8 pounds (nominal 20 pounds LP-gas
capacity) Devices using deep oil containers, (i.e. turkey fryers), are
not included in their exception.

IFC 603.4 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 603.4 Portable unvented heaters. Portable unvented fuel-fired
heaters shall be prohibited in occupancies in Group A, E, I, R-1, R-2,
R-3, and R-4.

IFC 806.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 806.1.1 Restricted occupancies. Natural cut trees shall be
prohibited in Group A, E, I-1, I-2, I-3, 1-4, M, R-1, R-2, and R-4
occupancies.

Exceptions:

1. Trees located in areas protected by an approved automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.1.1 or 903.1.2 shall
not be prohibited in Groups A, E, M, R-1 and R-2.

2. Trees shall be allowed within dwelling units in Group R-2
occupancies.

3. Trees located in churches and other places of worship provided each
tree has a two-day supply of water which when full covers the tree
stem no less than two inches.

IFC 903.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 903.2.8 Group R.

An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire
area.

Exception: Sprinklers are not required in single family dwelling or
residential buildings that contain no more than two dwelling units.
IFC 903.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 903.2.9 Group S-1.
An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all



(23)

(24)

buildings containing a Group S-1 occupancy where one of the following
conditions exists.

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet.

2. A Group S-1 fire area is located more than three stories above
grade plane.

3. The combined area of all group S-1 fire areas on all floors, including
mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet.

4. A Group S-1 fire area used for the storage of commercial motor
vehicles where the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

5. A Group S-1 occupancy used for the storage of upholster furniture
or mattresses exceeds 2,500 square feet.

6. A Group S-1 fire area where the usage is not determined at the time
of the building permit.

IFC 903.3.1.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 903.3.1.1.1 exempt locations. Automatic sprinklers shall not be
required in the following rooms or areas where such rooms or areas
are protected with an automatic fire detection system in accordance
with section 907.2 that will respond to visible or invisible particles of
combustion. Sprinklers shall not be omitted from a room merely
because it is damp or fire-resistance-rated construction or contains
electrical equipment.

1. A room where the application of water, or flame and water
constitute serious or fire hazard.

2. A room or space where sprinklers are considered undesirable
because of the nature of the contents, where approved by the fire
code official.

3. Generator and transformer rooms separated from the remainder of
the building by walls and floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies
having a fire resistance rating of not less than 2 hrs.

4. Rooms or areas that are noncombustible construction with wholly

noncombustible contents.

. Fire service access elevator machine rooms and machinery.

6. Machine rooms, machinery spaces, control rooms, and control
spaces associates with occupant evacuation elevator designed in
accordance with section 3008 of the International Building Code.

7. Sprinkler heads in unoccupied mall tenant spaces maybe installed at
ceiling height if allowed by the code official. Permission will be
granted on an individual basis. Combustible storage shall not be
allowed in these unoccupied tenant spaces if sprinkler heads are
installed at ceiling height. Signage shall be provided outlining the
storage restriction.

gl

IFC 903.3.5.3 is enacted to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Water Supply Pipe. Pipe and fittings for fire service water
supply piping from 5' outside building to the first flange above the floor
shall be as listed in NFPA 24. Ductile iron pipe shall be protected from
corrosion with sacrificial cathodic protection.



(25)

(26)

@7
(28)

(29)

IFC 905.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 905.3.1. Building height. Class | standpipe systems shall be
installed throughout buildings where the floor level of the highest story
is located more than thirty feet above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access, or where the floor level of the lowest story
is located more than thirty feet below the highest level of fire
department vehicular access.

IFC 905.3.4 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 905.3.4 Stages. Stages greater than 1,000 square feet (93 m? in
area shall be equipped with a Class | stand pipe system on each side
of the stage.

IFC 905.5 and 905.6 are deleted.
IFC 907.2.10.1 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 907.2.10.1 Group R-1.
Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed in all of the
following location in group R-1:

1. In sleeping areas.

2. In every room in the path of the means of egress from the sleeping
areas to the door leading from the sleeping unit.

3. In each story within the sleeping unit, including basements. For
sleeping units with split levels and without an intervening door
between the adjunct levels, a smoke alarm installed on the upper
level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that the
lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.

4. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a room open to the
hallway serving the sleeping rooms exceeds that of the hallway by
24 inches (610 mm) or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in
the hallway and in the adjacent room.

IFC 907.2.10.2 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 907.2.10.2 Group R-2, R-3, R-4 and 1-1.

Single- or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed in all of the
following location in group R-2, R-3, R-4 and I-1 regardless of
occupant load at all of the following locations:

1. On the ceiling or wall outside of each separate sleeping area in the
immediate vicinity of bedrooms.

2. In each room used for sleeping purposes.

3. In every room in the path of the means of egress from the sleeping
areas to the door leading from the sleeping unit.

4. In each story within the dwelling unit, including basements, but not
including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or
dwelling units with split level and without an intervening door
between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm installed on the upper
level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that the
lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.



5. In dwelling units where the ceiling height of a room open to the
hallway serving the sleeping rooms exceeds that of the hallway by
24 inches (610 mm) or more, smoke detectors shall be installed in
the hallway and in the adjacent room.

(30) IFC 907.8.3 is deleted.
(31) IFC 1030.3 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 1030.3 Maximum Height from floor. Emergency Escape and
rescue opening shall have the bottom of the clear opening not greater
than 48 inches measure from the floor.

(32) IFC 2303.1 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 2303.1 Location of dispensing devices: Dispensing devices
shall be located as follows:

1. 10 feet or more from lot lines.

2. 10 feet or more from buildings having combustible exterior wall
surfaces that are not part of a 1-hour fire-resistance-rated
assembly or buildings having combustible overhangs. Exception;
Canopies constructed accordance with the International building
Code providing weather protection for the fuel island.

3. Such that all portions of the vehicle being fueled will be on the
premises of the motor fuel-dispensing facility.

4. Such that the nozzle, when the hose is fully extended, will not
reach within 5 feet of the building openings.

5. Twenty feet or more from fixed sources of ignition.

6. On new installations, dispensing devices used to fill portable
containers with home heating fuels shall not be located on the
same island where class I liquids are dispensed.

(33) IFC section 6103.2.1.6 is amended to read as follows:

IFC 6103.2.1.6 Portable LP-Gas Containers. Portable LP-gas
containers are allowed to be used to supply approved self-contained
torch assemblies or similar appliances. Such containers shall not
exceed a water capacity of 12 pounds.

(34) Adopt Appendix B in its entirety.
(35) Adopt Appendix C in its entirety.
(36) Adopt Appendix D in its entirety.

Sec. 13-41. Restrictions on the storage of explosive and flammable
materials and the use of fireworks.

To the extent that the IFC refers to geographical limits—which limits are
specified or established outside the IFC—within which the storage of flammable
cryogenic fluids, Class | and Class Il liquids, and liquefied petroleum gas is
either prohibited or restricted (depending, at times, upon the amount of such
materials involved or other circumstances specified in the IFC), such geographic
limits shall be deemed to be the entire territorial jurisdiction to which the IFC
applies, except to the extent that such activity is specifically allowed in a
conditional use permit issued by the city council under the zoning ordinance.



Sec. 13-42, Parking in fire lanes prohibited.

(a) The designation of fire lanes on private property by the owner thereof,
which shall be dedicated for public use, shall be approved by the fire
marshal of the city and the chief of police.

(b) The parking of a motor vehicle within a designated fire lane or otherwise
obstructing a designated fire lane is prohibited.

Sec. 13-43. Conflicting provisions.

Inconsistencies between the fire code as amended by this article and other
parts of the city Code of Ordinances shall be resolved in favor of the other parts
of the Code of Ordinances.

This article shall become effective upon final passage and approval. No repeal
or amendment accomplished hereunder shall abate any right of enforcement
or cause of action which the city may enjoy immediately prior to the effective
date of this article.

Sec. 13-44. Charge Inspection Fees.

All fire permit, license, and inspection fees shall be set by resolution by the
Minot City Council and such resolution shall be filed with the City Finance
Director’s Office.

82 This ordinance shall become effective upon final passage and approval.

Passed on First Reading: January 16, 2024
Passed on Second Reading: February 5, 2024
ATTEST: APPROVED:

Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk Thomas Ross, Mayor



TO:

FROM:
DATE:
SUBJECT:

City of Minots

Mayor Tom Ross
Members of the City Council

Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk
February 5, 2024
ADMINISTRATIVE APPROVALS

l. RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended the City Council ratify the following administratively approved requests:

1.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.
18.

Perkett Elementary PTO to conduct a raffle on March 22, 2024 at Perkett
Elementary (2000 5t Ave SW).

Municipal Government Academy of ND to conduct a raffle on March 19, 2024 at
Clarion Hotel & Convention Center (2200 E Burdick Exwy).

Forgotten Warrior Foundation to conduct a raffle on June 29, 2024 at The
“O"riginal Bar and Nightclub (720 N Broadway).

Dakota Cruisers to conduct a raffle on June 5, 2024 and September 14, 2024 at
the Uhaul Moving and Storage S. Hill Parking Lot (1 20t Ave SE).

Minot High North Baseball to conduct a sports pool on February 11, 2024 at
Central Campus High School (215 1st St SE).

Souris River Basin Longbeards to conduct a raffle on February 10, 2024 at The
Grand Hotel (1505 N Broadway).

MSU Athletics to conduct a sports pool on February 11, 2024 at MSU (500
University Ave W).

Minot Y’s Men Club to conduct a raffle on June 17, 2024 at the Minot Family
YMCA (3515 16 St SW).

Minotauros Booster Club to conduct a raffle on April 7, 2024 at the Sleep Inn &
Suites (2400 10™ St SW).

Magic City Figure Skating Club to conduct a raffle on March 24, 2024 at the
Maysa Arena (2501 Burdick Exwy W).

Dakota Rattlers to conduct a raffle on April 28, 2024 at the MSU Dome Wrestling
Room (500 University Ave W).

Sigma Omicron Tau Chapter to conduct a calendar raffle May 2024 at Sigma
Omicron Tau C/0O Richell Johnson Residence (426 215t St NW).

Bel Air PTS to conduct bingo on February 15, 2024 and a raffle on April 19, 2024
at Bel Air Elementary (501 25" St NW).

MHS FBLA to conduct a raffle on February 23, 2024 at Magic City Campus (1100
11% Ave SW).

ND Association of Dance and Drill to conduct a raffle and bingo on February 17,
2024 at the Grand Hotel (1505 N Broadway).

Minot Symphony Association, Inc. to conduct a raffle on June 29, 2024 at The
“O"riginal Bar and Nightclub (720 N Broadway).

Special Event Permit for Der Blaue, LLC dba The Blue Rider (118 15t Ave SE).
Special Event Permit for Sports on Tap, Inc. dba Sports on Tap (220 S
Broadway).

Page 1 of 3



19. Special Event Permit for Atypical, LLC dba Atypical Brewery & Barrelworks (510
E Central Ave).

20. Special Event Permit for Der VennMitchell, Inc dba The Landing Bar and
Bottleshop (2015 N Broadway).

1. DEPARTMENT CONTACT PERSONS

John Klug, Police Chief 857-4715
Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk 857-4752

1i. DESCRIPTION

A. Background
Under the Code of Ordinances, a permit issued pursuant to NDCC 5-02-01.1, to allow

an alcoholic beverage sales licensee to operate at premises other than the licensed
premises to which the license relates, shall be issued administratively by the city clerk
upon the following terms and conditions:

1. The payment by the applicant of a nonrefundable fee of twenty-five dollars
($25.00).
2. The submission by the applicant, as part of the application required by the city
clerk, of a brief narrative explaining:
a. The nature of the occasion for the permit (e.g., wedding dance, trade
show or promotion, etc.); and
b. The steps which will be undertaken by the permittee to restrict the sale
to, and consumption of, alcoholic beverages by minors at such occasion.
3. The written approval by the chief of police of the issuance of the permit.
4. A permit issued pursuant to this subsection may not be used for the off-sale of
alcoholic beverages.

An application for local authorization pertaining to gaming, other than site approval,
shall be issued administratively by the city clerk upon the following terms and
conditions:
1. The payment by the applicant of a fee [of $25].
2. The submission by the applicant, as part of the application required by the city
clerk, of the following:
a. The appropriate form and other information prescribed or recommended
by the attorney general; or
b. If there is no prescribed or recommended form, then a brief narrative
explaining the particulars whereby the applicant should be considered to
be qualified under state law for the particular local authorization sought;
what the net proceeds will be expended for; and such other information,
if any, as the city clerk may reasonably require to assist him in
administering this subsection.
3. The written approval by the chief of police of the issuance of the authorization.

Each month, a report shall be provided to the city council concerning the permits
allowed and the permits denied under this subsection subsequent to the last prior such
report.

1v. IMPACT:

Page 2 of 3



VI.

VII.

Special Event Permits, Local Permits and Restricted Event Permits are approved
administratively each month through the City Clerk’s Office. The non-refundable
application fee for each permit is $25 and is deposited into the appropriate general fund
revenue accounts.

ALTERNATIVES
N/A - the request is to ratify the applications which have been administratively
approved.

TIME CONSTRAINTS: N/A

LIST OF ATTACHMENTS: None

Page 3 of 3



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv 'ﬂf Hfﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 1 of 13

Home Department Description: Air

Baier, Jamison T $ 4,440.50
Brock, Vanessa M $4,042.43
Brock, William $4,929.22
Choi, Alex M $5,683.74
Clark, Benjamin P $ 4,500.06
Davis, Brandon $ 5,504.94
Depriest, Isaac $ 4,856.94
Dickson, Earnest edward $5,420.81
Draper, David $5,324.76
Eckman, Jennifer Kristin $ 11,756.38
Hernandez, Joe $4,624.90
Kaminski, Thomas $3,574.73
Klein, Craig A $4,421.76
Long, Jessica $6,216.76
McCuaig, Tyler $1,722.45
Moody, Sharon $4,482.78
Norby, Judy $4,765.78
Ortiz-Pabon, Nelson $ 4,597.20
Rafala, Michael $5,701.16
Romanick, Maria C $6,531.54
Schriock, Brittany R $ 3,560.40
Takashige, Alec N $5,910.90
Urban, Randy N $3,531.69
Warbis, Conner Joseph $1,410.40

Home Department Description: Assessors

Druse, Damon $8,291.38
Kamrowski, Ryan L $9,228.84
Lovelace, Daniel D $ 6,556.20
Maragos, Sheila M $6,887.42
Nelson, Chelsy $ 3,700.80
Schlecht, Dustin J $ 7,058.60

Home Department Description: Cemetery

Roteliuk, Rondel R $6,719.76
Sanford, Allison Beth $5,265.39
Seifert, James R $ 4,269.64
Zietz, Cole J $4,087.24

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv of “fﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 2 of 13

Home Department Description: City Attorney

Dickerson, Corbin $ 7,958.40
Henjum, Nathaniel $ 4,400.00
Horst, Nancy $5,387.75
Schmitz, Nick $ 7,389.76
Stalheim, Stefanie $11,244.46

Home Department Description: City Manager

Kleen, Jennifer LeAnn $6,531.20
Kvigne, T $4,762.60
McWilliams, Mikayla $ 6,349.46
Obenchain, Bryan $5,002.60
Schraeder, Ann M $4,833.44
Stewart, Harold Leroy $ 15,572.54

Home Department Description: City Shop

Anderson, Robbie $4,187.20
Doyle, April S $ 3,653.64
Headrick, Jesse $3,624.74
Hermanson, Brook A $ 4,283.38
Horinka, Brian L $8,725.92
Marsh, Timothy D $5,323.82
Ortmann, Donald G $6,280.76
Rivera, Frank R $ 4,283.38
Sampson, Jody S $6,636.61
Whetstine, Koby W $4,635.41

Home Department Description: Dispatch

Alves, Jeanne E $5,882.58
Bjertness, Lacie J $ 6,766.49
Christie, Sean A $ 8,949.80
Evans, Amy $ 4,587.80
Haugan, Margaret H $ 7,389.76
Lausch, Jacqueline $6,272.77
Lonis, Ashleigh $5,356.51
Monk, Harry $3,170.20
Moreno, Christina Rachel $ 3,669.63
Newman, Samantha $ 5,596.86
Olson, Justice $4,268.90
Perius, Juana $6,531.54

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv 'ﬂf Hfﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 3 of 13

Roehm, Brandi $4,432.18
Schmidt, Lindsey Marie $3,712.57
Schoen, Molly $4,741.90
Sorensen, Elizabeth A $ 8,329.65
Van Hill, Shanlya M $ 7,549.40

Home Department Description: Engineering

Erickson, Aleesha L $ 6,662.24
Foley, Taylor $ 4,400.83
Hoffart, Jesse $6,694.76
Huettl, Emily $9,228.84
King, Matthew R $6,694.76
Meyer, Lance E $12,109.08
Ramos, Nicole $5,230.00
Randash, Alexander X $676.50
Romann, Alicia A $4,977.60
Steckler, Thomas E $ 7,389.76
Swartz-Dahl, Sami $ 4,737.60
Vorgitch, Julia $4,410.18

Home Department Description: Finance

Burns, Callie S $6,065.17
Grabow, Randi L $4,977.92
Kuivenhoven, Janet K $2,488.96
Lakefield, David $12,450.84
Molina, Crystal R $4,510.41
Olson, Jaelee $4,481.13
Schmidt, Susan $4,977.92
Shefstad, Brittany J $5,360.70
Shelkey, Melody L $7,209.54
Stein, Jeanne $6,694.76
Van Grinsven, Kristin $6,216.76
Variste, Jeanny $ 4,552.92
Zeece, Holly $5,410.96
Zelinski, Jenna M $ 7,958.00

Home Department Description: Fire - Administration

Babinchak, Jason A $8,360.92
Berg, Lorie A $6,925.02
Brown, Robby $6,241.02
Hammer, Stuart $6,241.01
Kronschnabel, Kelli $12,450.84

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



City of Minots

City Clerk Report

Date: 02/01/2024
Page: 4 of 13

Seifert, Travis J
Summers, Dana W
Weber, Brent A

$6,792.00
$5,941.80
$8,360.92

Home Department Description: Fire Control

Aberle, Christopher
Allen, Scott
Anderson, Joseph
Angelo, Jason
Baker, Griffin Joseph
Beck, Kyle W

Bell, Ryan A
Berntson, Austin
Blackwood, Robert
Boechler, Matthew A
Burgess, Justin T
Burns, Austin T
Christen, Tyler P
Coleman, Alexander
Croxall, Jeremy M
Degele, Travis W
Dockter, James
Eull, Mitchell
Fernandez, Jacob S
Filkins, Jacob E
Fylling, Jacob
Garberg, Tully D
Ghent, Tyler

Gilliss, Shane
Givens, Andrew
Hanselman, Andrew J
Hanson, Jonathan
Hanson, Myles
Hardy, Glen A
Hayden, Jameson
Kristiansen, Hans
Laks, Damon
Laskowski, Paul J
Lentz, Jacob W
Mathieson, Mark
Maxwell, Mason W
Meadows, Casey D
Meadows, Jaydee
Meyer, Trent

$7,843.92
$5,102.72
$4,811.07
$5,284.96
$4,149.04
$8,087.20
$ 3,852.68
$5,435.10
$6,942.00
$4,992.52
$8,907.30
$ 8,685.56
$5,133.15
$6,610.66
$9,801.82
$7,843.92
$5,677.40
$6,446.74
$5,269.00
$6,129.44
$5,467.20
$6,713.09
$4,010.16
$8,007.00
$5,190.64
$7,438.20
$5,551.76
$ 7,206.54
$10,860.60
$4,510.42
$11,776.66
$ 4,906.80
$11,157.31
$8,892.03
$6,141.05
$9,846.80
$7,356.77
$5,230.41
$4,010.16

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM

Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv 'ﬂf “fﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 5 of 13

Nerem, Jesse $ 5,284.96
Newman, Phillip $5,832.67
Olson, Joshua $6,141.05
Orr, Jeremiah $6,611.82
Peterson, Aaron P $ 8,655.36
Raymond, Daniel $8,578.43
Rice, Alec D $ 4,632.96
Rohrbach, Robert A $6,396.24
Ross, Michael T $ 6,446.38
Rostberg, Casey $7,502.15
Safranski, Dustin M $6,396.24
Schill, Kyle $7,664.33
Schriock, Kerry W $8,925.84
Shoemaker, Charles $ 6,088.51
Sickles, Chad $6,224.49
Staples, Kayden $ 5,034.40
Tancabel, Andrew $9,465.21
Taylor, Matthew $ 4,548.32
Tougas, Brady W $ 5,358.20
Urban, Augustus $ 6,293.59
Walhood, Bradley $5,837.50
Walter, Devin M $8,114.40
West, Jason $7,831.18
Zabka, Aaron $5,284.96

Home Department Description: Human Resources

Jundt, Lisa R $10,211.92
Porterfield, Monica L $6,445.54
Scott, Courtney K $4,647.54
Thurston, Brittany $6,474.89

Home Department Description: IT

Albertson, Alec $6,176.71
Herslip, Jacob $ 3,932.32
Knudsvig, Miles $ 5,002.60
McKibben, Jason S $ 8,834.16
Podolski, Tyler $3,914.22
Ulrickson, Paul M $8,619.92

Home Department Description: Inspections

Bischof, Duran $5,633.60
Degroot, Gage $7,353.60

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



City of Minots

City Clerk Report

Date: 02/01/2024
Page: 6 of 13

Falconer, Daniel
Falkinburg, Delores D
Hancock, Thomas
Kilichowski, Owen J
Kimball, Michelle L
Murphy, Michael J
Sickler, Laurie A
Tillema, Luke
Walker, Richard E

Home Department Description: Landfill

$ 720.00

$4,875.73
$1,215.00
$5,936.40
$5,230.40
$6,862.40
$5,091.21
$9,003.76
$6,862.40

Akin, Dwayne S
Anderson, Melissa Ann
Boucher, Robbie R
Bullard-Wolf, Christina
Bullard-Wolf, Travis D
Curelo, Steven

Foster, Krystle A
Hammer, Lorne R
Helgeson, David
Reimche, Tyler J
Shefstad, Allen

Zuck, Darren S

$ 3,700.81
$2,776.73
$4,517.45
$ 4,856.00
$ 4,400.83
$4,187.72
$3,195.73
$5,227.42
$4,792.28
$5,360.39
$5,917.91
$4,979.16

Home Department Description: Library

Aberle, Craig S
Anderson, Brandon
Bercier, Georgianna
Brown, Leah M
Carswell, Pamela E
Fagerland, Benjamin
Hensley, Holly
Huseth, Valerie
Julson, Marcia G
Kranz, Martina Louise
Lien, Kathryn

Miller, Emily

Monley, Randi D
Moya, Zhaina
Ostlund, Emily
Payne, Kristina
Pecoraro, Betty
Pikka, Joshua

$3,572.32
$538.10
$1,003.36
$1,161.63
$4,949.91
$1,067.57
$2,145.56
$ 3,428.80
$4,292.80
$690.19
$2,927.68
$7.69
$4,504.94
$7,076.92
$ 4,200.00
$570.45
$1,445.80
$5,765.96

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM

Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv ﬂf “fﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 7 of 13

Possen, Lacey A
Schneibel, Veronica
Timothy, Scott D
Wheeler, Mary P
Williams, David J
Williams, Jillian

Wolf, Julie M

Ziegler, Kassandra M

$ 3,866.90
$4,078.84
$5,443.07
$5,368.80
$1,381.47
$1,058.51
$3,382.27
$3,344.42

Home Department Description: Municipal Court

Beall, Ashley
Dodge, Cindy J
Nishek, Laurie
Tallman, Nicole
Terry, Faron

$4,618.16
$3,128.30
$5,102.38
$ 4,250.79
$ 600.00

Home Department Description: National Disaster Recover

Barrette, Anthony
Plank, Christopher J

$4,510.40
$5,494.40

Home Department Description: Planning

Billingsley, Brian
Diedrichsen, Douglas Craig
Falconer, Daniel
Rosenthal, Jonathan

Zietz, Marjorie

$10,970.24
$8,157.00
$2,081.38
$10,113.38
$5,334.40

Home Department Description: Police - Administration

Bachmeier, Kendra
Chapman, David J
Church, Jenna J
Foley, Jared S
Gessner, Cheryl K
Guthrie, Trisha K
Haug, Shane M
Klug, John M
Kolnes, Kimberly
McLeod, Matthew T
Olson, Ashley
Roberts, Christine L

$2,911.62
$ 8,360.92
$3,211.35
$8,776.36
$ 8,236.04
$4,225.15
$ 8,569.92
$10,970.24
$3,193.40
$ 8,360.92
$4,292.80
$4,936.43

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM

Powered by ADP



City of Minots

City Clerk Report

Date: 02/01/2024
Page: 8 of 13

Sandusky, Caisee M
Shaw, Jarred
Stanfield, Carrie A
Sumlin, Robbie M
Sundbakken, Jason J
Watne, Mitchell R
Williams, Brian

$7,226.72
$ 6,950.04
$5,303.97
$7,201.46
$9,696.08
$5,117.13
$6,814.70

Home Department Description: Police - Investigations

Asham, Carmen L
Bonney, Erin L
Casarez, Andres
Denovio, William
Dyke, Darren M
Eisenzimmer, Cameon
Guerton, Kristin
Hanks, Elijah
Heringer, Rebecca
Johnson, Charles S
Johnson, Greg W
Lentz, Stephanie M
Miller, Gannon E
Plessas, Dale J
Roach, Andrew
Wilkerson, Roman

$9,824.18
$7,444.45
$7,436.06
$5,474.61
$ 8,569.92
$ 4,209.97
$6,341.40
$6,163.46
$ 4,665.17
$8,471.29
$7,297.01
$8,258.70
$6,017.59
$9,459.62
$7,325.86
$11,909.78

Home Department Description: Police - Patrol

Adelman, Shane
Andrade, Memorie
Asham, Carmen L
Bach, Kolbe M
Bambenek, Jason L
Bartlett, Alec
Batteiger, Daniel W
Becker, Krysta
Berentson, Taylor
Black, Winston
Boswell, Jordan
Boyungs JR, Craig
Burghardt, Thomas
Burns, Paul C
Burtch, Tyler R
Carter, Ronald

$6,370.34
$8,245.71
$9,824.18
$ 6,333.69
$8,132.60
$2,724.30
$8,942.22
$ 8,507.07
$5,037.25
$1,605.00
$ 5,058.84
$5,149.18
$4,746.50
$8,631.81
$5,361.48
$6,652.78

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM

Powered by ADP



Cit‘f of Mi‘ﬁs City Clerk Report Date: 02/01/2024

Page: 9 of 13

Casarez, Andres $ 7,436.06
Connole, Michael W $7,183.76
Denovio, William $5,474.61
Evans, Amy $ 4,587.80
Gladback, Belinda $7,218.50
Gonzales, Daniel $4,749.86
Hall, Cullen $6,786.07
Harrington, Alexander D $6,429.22
Hathaway, Eric $5,213.71
Haug, Shane M $ 8,569.92
Hess, Andrew M $6,356.78
Hugg, Anthony $6,077.13
Jensen, Taylor A $9,346.63
Kiss, Sarah $4,901.52
Knutson, Zachary W $5,419.19
Labodda, Seth $5,962.16
Lakoduk, Ross Allen Macklin $ 7,360.70
Lovro, Mary Sanford $ 3,702.65
McLeod, Matthew T $ 8,360.92
Mehlhoff, Andrew K $ 7,186.86
Miller, Cody $ 7,416.90
Miller, Gannon E $6,017.59
Myers, Zackery Colin $6,876.53
Noyes, Joshua D $7,897.13
Olson, Jacob $9,228.04
Pfeiffer, Peggy $5,362.76
Pollman, Dana $ 8,108.60
Presley, Jessica L $5,496.33
Reis, Shawn $ 8,208.56
Roach, Andrew $ 7,325.86
Roberts, Bobby R $ 4,862.85
Ruelle, Tyler J $7,916.73
Schoenrock, Stephen J $7,418.11
Shaide, Kristian $7,108.94
Shaw, Jarred $ 6,950.04
Somerville, Amanda M $4,102.93
Stanfield, Carrie A $ 5,303.97
Stebleton, Tatum $5,035.72
Strandemo, Cole A $8,175.23
Suarez, Jonathan $ 4,752.00
Sullivan, Christian $5,376.68
Sumlin, Robbie M $7,201.46
Sundheim, Justin C $9,696.08
Washington, Anthony L $7,216.40
Watne, Mitchell R $5,117.13

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv ﬂf “fﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 10 of 13

Wegner, Shawn P $8,725.92
Wheeler, Daniel B $9,332.15
Wilkes, Jordan R $5,402.33
Williams, Brian $6,814.70

Home Department Description: Property Maintenance

Eichstadt, Jacob $4,513.78
Espe, Scott A $3,599.61
Frazier, Eric $4,858.12
Heizelman, Grant L $6,377.79
Knatterud, Dena M $ 3,690.39
Lee, Rebecca $ 2,960.05
Randash, Shawn A $4,482.56
Rice, Alec D $4,632.96
Sickler, Kevin $8,725.92
West, Samantha M $ 3,304.62

Home Department Description: Public Works - Administra

Cofell, Benjamin H $7,763.92
Cuypers, Anthony J $ 3,986.35
Hoyt, Kari L $5,515.69
Jensen, Debra $ 3,453.88
Meyer, Veronica M $ 8,569.92
Schettler, Tristan $5,230.00
Sorenson, Jason S $11,559.71

Home Department Description: Sanitation

Arriola, Joseph E $5,106.09
Hamel, Scott $6,127.91
Hammer, Reid $4,673.83
Ingold, Douglas A $4,758.77
Kraft, Joshua B $8,172.00
Lakoduk, Daltyn J $ 4,995.62
Marten, Harold L $4,448.13
Oange, Zephaniah N $4,738.83
Reynolds, Nicholas R $ 6,489.32
Shurtleff, Michael J $ 4,030.39
Simonson, Christopher A $4,977.41

Home Department Description: Sewer Pumping

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv 'ﬂf Mfﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 11 of 13

Allen, Bryce J $3,748.91
Brevik, Dax $ 4,734.05
Cimino, Robert Paul $ 4,450.35
Keller, Eric J $6,531.20
Kuglin, Troy D $5,103.36
LaValley, Christopher $3,192.00
Marmon, Shannon L $5,818.04
Olstad, Karlain L $3,776.16
Sloboden, Timothy J $5,684.81

Home Department Description: Storm-Sewer

Berg, Jared $ 3,038.40
Espe, Mark W $ 6,065.60
Heizelman, Dean A $ 3,888.00
Herslip, Christopher C $ 3,888.00
Hogencamp, Matthew $ 3,038.41
Iglesias, Adrian $ 4,737.60
Kueffler, Alexander $ 3,038.41

Home Department Description: Street Department

Braaten, Kevin A $8,569.92
Chogquette, Marc F $5,607.97
Ciccarelli, Robert S $4,523.53
Edwards, Nicholas S $4,143.87
Foster, Jacob $6,309.78
Fredericksen, Brandon L $5,623.66
Funke, Danny J $ 480.00

Grant, Zachary L $6,681.22
Gruse, Richard $3,114.36
Harvey, Dale A $5,745.83
Heizelman, Dean A $ 3,888.00
Herslip, Christopher C $ 3,888.00
Herzog, Rodney $4,178.93
Huntzinger, Brian D $5,413.15
Lower, Robert $4,763.54
MacKay, Brooke $ 4,086.40
Monk, Harry $3,170.20
Monley, Lucus $4,993.14
Neuhalfen, Scott J $ 3,348.68
Oberdick, Wilfred $ 4,699.36
Oswalt, Matthew $4,521.38
Patterson Jr., Rex $ 3,049.89
Poole, Kellen $1,177.38

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



Date: 02/01/2024
Citv ﬂf “fﬁ%ﬁ City Clerk Report ate

Page: 12 of 13

Reynolds, Nicholas R $6,489.32
Sanchez, David L $3,861.21
Scofield, Garrett D $6,240.48
Skinner, Lehmann $4,625.35
Torres, Diego Enrique $2,984.66
Vind, Roger T $5,589.99
Wood, Justin G $5,677.39

Home Department Description: Traffic

Behrens, Jeffrey W $5,778.93
Bieger, Michael $3,277.01
Degenstein, Joseph $4,705.67
Derr, Nathan P $4,703.71
Joersz, Stephen $9,033.76
Rodman, David F $7,762.35
Sanchez, David L $3,861.21
Steen, Jeffery $2,108.78

Home Department Description: Transit/Bus

Billings, Angeliqgue M $1,600.97
Billings, Douglas E $3,610.75
Cooper, Dean $1,471.85
Cutaiar, Joseph $5,735.80
Hochsprung, Kory $4,132.91
Newbury, Tina M $4,187.20
Schalesky, Marty $3,121.97
Shekleton, Michael $4,189.03
Sigurdson, Debbie $4,716.64
Tinkle, Staci $ 316.65

Home Department Description: Utility Billing

Duchscherer, Haili $4,198.98
Dutenhafer, Miranda S $5,301.88
Grilley, Jamie N $ 3,283.14

Home Department Description: Water Distribtuion

Bell, Ryan A $ 3,852.68
Bergrude, Carson $3,192.40
Brandt, Kelly G $6,492.10
Burckhard, Terry $ 1,455.96

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM Powered by ADP



City of Minots

City Clerk Report

Date: 02/01/2024
Page: 13 of 13

Burnley, Cory
Christianson, Kurt A
Finken, Chad G
Gable, Joseph shane
Hudson, Kasey L
Kelly, Kevin J

Knoop, Scot M
Lockyer, Cody M
Opperude, Darin B
Randash, Brian K
Reisenauer, Rick
Reynolds, John E
Rieke, Dustin B
Robinson, Derek
Schnase, Cyndi J
Sloboden, Jacob
Westergaard, Steve B
Wiggins, Kaitlynn

$3,192.40
$5,331.20
$5,886.02
$ 3,195.69
$5,127.27
$5,341.07
$5,103.05
$4,341.16
$3,523.20
$6,063.71
$4,455.79
$7,574.54
$5,502.39
$4,582.85
$ 4,855.39
$3,524.74
$ 6,603.87
$3,821.13

Home Department Description: Water Treatement Plant

Andrysiak, Richard J
Dinsmoore, Marissa R
Fjeld, Debra A

Haider, Mark A

Hall, Steven M

Herd, Peter J
Kittelson, Collin

Kopp, Timothy J
Lopez, Ryan

O'Keefe, Kevin
Paddock, Mark A
Parton, Janet L
Pederson, Robert A
Reimche, Keith R
Rensland, Brandon T
Seifert, Justin R
Walker, James Alonso

Grand Totals
Total

$4,737.60
$ 3,699.36
$1,032.79
$6,701.28
$1,512.68
$ 3,875.52
$ 4,400.00
$5,226.48
$4,471.20
$4,622.40
$ 8,669.85
$5,236.28
$5,753.44
$5,331.20
$6,397.44
$6,576.20
$4,471.20

$ 2,668,830.48

Generated on 02/01/2024 09:25 AM

Powered by ADP



Monthly Bills Paid

Check Date Check Run

12/28/2023

12/29/2023

FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
FSA1223
V122923
V122923

V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923
V122923

V122923
V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

Check
Number

100004931
100004932
100004933
100004934
100004935
100004936
100004937
100004938
100004939
100004940
100004941
100004942
100004943
100004944
100004945
100004946
100004947
100004948
100004949
100004950
100004951
100004952

299239

299240

299241
299242
299243
299244
299245
299246
299267
299247
299248
299249
299250
299251

299252
299253

299254
299255
299256
299257
299259
299260
299261

299262

299263

299258

299264

299265

Vendor Name

WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
WEX HEALTH, INC
ALL SEASON ARENA
AMERICAN TRUCK &
TRAIIFR.I1C
BAYCOM, INC.
BLUE360 MEDIA, LLC
BORDER STATES

INDUSTRIFS. INC
BUTLER MACHINERY

cO
CDM SMITH

CONCRETE MOBILE
CREA
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
ENERBASE

FACTORY MOTOR

PARTS
FLEETMIND

SOIUTIONS. INC
FLEXIBLE PIPE TOOLS

& FOUIPMENT
GENERAL TRADING

GERDAU RECYCLING
GUARDIAN FLEET

SAFFTY
HAWKINS, INC.
HOGAN

MANUFACTURING, INC

HOUSTON

FNGINFFRING. INC
INFORMATION

TECHNOLOGY
NEDADTNMENIT

JOHN DEERE

FINANCIAI
KLJ ENGINEERING, LLC

LINDE GAS &
FOUIPMENT INC

Payee Name

Brook Hermanson
Holly Zeece
Jaelee Olson
Joshua Noyes

Samantha Newman

Comment

December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
December 2023 Discovery Benefi
LODGING TAXES COLLECTED
TJD7000S JACK, 8K SQUARE TUBE

Panasonic CF33 Keyboard for Pa
NDCC Manuals
Analog combination modules

30W TDTO 2.5 GAL

CDM SMITH CONTRACT - NDR
Concrete Blocks for Street Dep
Minot Area Career Expo Booth S
Tuition Reimbursement Math 210

2023 Travel Expenses- Holly Ze
2023 Mileage- Bank runs
Tuition Reimbursement Dev of S
Tuition Reimbursement 1st Year

FUEL; FORKLIFT PROPANE
FILTER-TRANS; TRANS FILTER KIT

December 2023 Monthly Data Pla
6" suction hose

007; ELECTRICAL TAPE
STEEL; STEEL AS NEEDED
P4 Upfitting and Equipment

Fluoride
VOID AFTER UPDATE 01/09/2024

3673A - 16TH STREET SW FLOOD
c

VPN/MFA/STATE NET FIBER NOV
2

RESTOCKING CHARGE returned
4398 - CITY HALL RETAINING WAL

WELDING CLAMP 12 W/3 PCS SU

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

Check Amount

$74.99
$1,521.52
$5.79
$41.13
$127.98
($90.00)
$55.40
$133.56
$44.17
$2,571.26
$795.70
$19.65
$1,190.54
$218.85
$80.86
$1,771.27
$174.37
$92.52
$85.00
$265.28
$648.29
$280.08
$2,635.45
$96.41

$597.00
$5,986.00
$1,039.98
$149.10
$78,493.20
$1,600.00
$200.00
$1,000.00
$36.34
$18.73
$895.95
$1,000.00

$1,143.62
$302.38

$3,047.58
$1,280.00
$202.30
$1,404.94
$9,083.31
$2,411.64
$0.00

$7,762.00

$3,181.75

$2,804.15
$3,957.12

$181.44

Void Amount

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$292.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00




01/02/2024

01/05/2024

V122923

V122923
V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923
V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923
V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923
V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V122923

V010224

JV010524

JV010524

ADPO124

ADPO124

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

299266

299268
299269

299270

299271

299272
299273

299274

299275

299276

299277

299278

299279

299280

299281
299282

299283

299284

299285
299286

299287

299288

299289

299290

299291

299292

299293

299294

299295

100004959

100004960

299296

299297

299298
299299

299342
299300

299301

299302

299303

299304

299305

299306

MAIN ELECTRIC

CONSTRUCTION
MINOT AUTO

MINOT WELDING INC

MOUSE RIVER

FIRFFIGHTFR'S ASSN
NAPA AUTO PARTS

NEXTREQUEST
NORMONT

FOUIPMENT CO
NORTHWEST TIRE
AND RFTRFAD
PRAIRIE ENGINEERING,

PC
PROJECT BEE

RDO EQUIPMENT
ROUTEMATCH

SOFTWARF 11 C
SANITATION

PRODUCTS
SCHOCKS SAFE AND

1 OCK SFRVICF
SIGN SOLUTIONS USA
SPX TECHNOLOGIES,
INC
SWANSTON

EQUIPMENT
FONMDANIES

TERMINAL SUPPLY CO.

THEIN WELL
THORSRUD SUPPLY

CO.INC
UNUM LIFE

INSURANCF
VISIT MINOT

WALLWORK TRUCK

CENTFR
WARD COUNTY

AUDITOR
WESTLIE FORD

WESTLIE TRUCK

CENTFR
EIDE FORD LINCOLN

1 CALL SEPTIC

SFRVICFS. INC
ACME TOOLS

ADP, INC
ADP, INC
ALL SEASON ARENA
AMERICAN WELDING
& GAS. INC
APH/AUTO VALUE
ASSETWORKS

CITY OF MINOT
CLUTE OFFICE EQUIP.,

INC
COOKIES FOR YOU

ECOLAB PEST
ELIMINATION

NIN/ICINN

EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY

Andres Casarez
Dusty Schlecht
James Seifert

Krystle Foster

PO 4397 - Install UPS for 37th

--; FRONT STRUT
Minot Welding Search Expense C

2024 Membership Dues

008; 75W90 SYNTHETICAL GEAR

ol
Records request processing and
Nitrogen Canister Cylinder

-- ALIGNMENT
Electrical Design Phase

VOID AFTER UPDATE 12/29/2023
SEAL KIT; SEAL KIT
Core System & Hosting Fees

HYDRAULIC; HYD MOTOR
SWAT Bus Cabinets

HIP .100 12" X 12" Sign Digita
Transit fare media freight

HYDRAULIC; HYDRAULIC FLUID

PLUG; CONNECTOR PLUG

Invoice 8786, well A completed
Lock Boxes

NOVEMBER 2023 PREMIUM
December 2023 Motor Vehicle Ta
003; BRAKE DRUM

October 2023 inmate invoice -

ALREADY GRABBED ALTERNATOR

RRA
PROXIMITY SWITCH ASSY

CONNFCTO
WCNTF VEHICLES - ANNUAL

| FASIN
Trucking- Third Party Disposal

001; AIR FILTER

ADP Payroll Services for Decem
ADP Payroll Services for Decem
LODGING TAXES COLLECTED
co2

Credit on Account 47000036
4423 - CITYWIDE ASSET
MANAGFMF

Dylan Wagner Restitution MI-20
PAYMENT FOR 2023 CHARGES

ON IN
OFFICE SPACE RENTAL

PD Pest Control- Exterior Serv
Tuition Reimbursement College
Reimbursement for appraiser pe
Tuition Reimbursement Principl

December 2023 Mileage- Krystle

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$8,616.19

$402.42
$2,500.00

$25.00
$2,196.07

$9,572.64
$97.39

$1,049.67
$200.00
$0.00
$428.37
$24,313.76
$3,819.98

$309.64

$112.75
$6,840.28

$748.39

$53.97

$7,127.05
$468.00

$5,083.95
$6,431.46
$583.16
$17,875.00
$376.19
$943.97
$23,400.00
$13,137.30
$59.82
$15,537.42
$874.20
$7,676.62

$9,683.95

$36.79
$8,581.47

$200.00
$756.50

$900.00
$697.54
$673.46
$350.00
$729.00

$39.63

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$559,622.39
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

299307

299308

299309

299310

299311

299312

299313

299314

299315
299316

299317

299318

299319

299320

299321

299322

299323

299324

299325

299326

299327

299328

299329

299330

299331
299332

299333

299334

299335

299336

299337

299338
299339

299340

299341

299343
299344

299345

299346

299347
299348

299349

EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
ENERBASE

FASTENAL COMPANY
FIRST INTERNATIONAL
BANK & TRUST

FIRST WESTERN
INSURANCF
GALLS, LLC

GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL TRADING

GERDAU RECYCLING
GOETTLE LAW, PLLC
GRAYBAR

GRAYMONT WESTERN
US INC
HAWKINS, INC.
INLAND TRUCK PARTS
cO
INTERNATIONAL CITY
MANAGEMENT

ACCNCIATINN DET

INTERSTATE BATTERY

SYSTEM
KIWANIS CLUB OF

MINOT
MAIN ELECTRIC

CONSTRUCTION
MARCO, INC.

MINOT AUTO
MINOT EMPLOYEE

DONATIONS
MINOT PARK DISTRICT

MINOT PLUMBING &

HFATING CO. INC
NAPA AUTO PARTS

ND DEPT OF

TRANSPORTATION
NORTH COUNTRY

SPORTSWFAR
NORTHERN PLAINS

FOUIPMENT CO.. INC
NORTHERN TESTING

NORTHWEST TIRE

AND RFTRFAD
PFM FINANCIAL

ADVISORS |1 C

Melissa Anderson
Rob Cimino
Rondel Roteliuk

Rondel Roteliuk

Amber Marquardt
Braxton Wynton
Celine Marx
Cody Cerner
Jane Ellis
Joe Melvin Stenvold, Jr.
Katelynn Bowen
Kevina OM Click
Shandel Grogan

U.S. Postal Service

December 2023 Mileage- Melissa
Drop off pumps for repair
November 2023 Mileage- Rod Rot
December 2023 Mileage- Rondel
UNLEADED

10-24 NYLOCK NM Z 100 PACK
Fire Union Due's

AIRPORT LIABILITY INSURANCE

pants for Myers
Isaac Marden Restitution MI-20

Larissa Monson Restitution MI-
Jorden Mello Restitution MI-20
Cheyanne Swain Restitution MI-
Cheyanne Swain Restitution MI-
Jessie Casey Restitution MI-20
Bryan Steir Restitution MI-202
Wendy Beston Restitution MI-20
Jeanie Brault Restitution MI-2
Logan Cassell Restitution MI-2
10-24 X 2 1/4 RH STOVE BOLT
STEEL; STEEL AS NEEDED
January 2024 Retainer

DBL END TYPE B GLASS 4FT TUBE
Lime

Fluoride
SPRING; U-BOLT INLAND TRUCK
cu

City manager pension

007; BATTERY MTP-65

Kiwanis Q1 Membership Fee
Labor and Enviromental Fee
Marco Copier Maintenance INV 1

SEAL; PTO SEAL
Minot Employee Donations

December 2023 State Aid to Par
Installation of a new water co

PIPE BUSHING
4563 - BURDICK EXPY VIADUCT

RF
JACKET, HOODIE, 2 POLO'S, EMBR

HOUSING; F/W SEPARATOR

HOUSING
Drug test, breath & DOT
TIRE PRESSURE MONITOR

CONTINUING DISCLOSURE
ANNLUAI R

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$39.63
$29.50
$45.20
$25.55
$11,939.73
$4.99
$704.00
$14,350.00

$166.52
$1,221.73

$30.00
$40.00
$5.00
$5.00
$200.00
$25.00
$23.00
$50.00
$50.00
$435.40
$152.29
$3,500.00
$1,174.00

$53,252.25

$31,798.28
$192.36

$624.56

$153.95
$450.00
$44,402.66
$192.50

$140.69
$870.24

$62,695.67
$1,589.00

$1,692.19
$10,823.05

$144.04
$514.84

$605.00
$478.04

$1,500.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



01/08/2024

01/09/2024

01/11/2024

01/12/2024

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

JV010524
JV010524

EM010524

EM010524

PM010924

V011124

NDRE1223

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

AP168

299350

299351

299352

299353

299354

299355

299356

299357

299358

299359

299360

299361

299362

299363

299364
299365

299366

299367

299368
299369

299370

299371

299372

299373

299374

299375
299376

299377
299378

100004954

100004957

100004956

299379

100004958

100005011

100005012

100005013

100005014

100005015

PRINGLE &

HFRIGSTAD. P.C
PROTECH

INTFGRATIONS. 11 C
REDSTONE

TFCHNOI OGIFS. INC
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
REFUND ONE TIME

PAY
RINKER MATERIALS

ROLLKALL

TFCHNOIOGIFS 1 C
SANITATION

PRODUCTS
SHORT ELLIOTT

HENDRICKSON. INC
SIGN SOLUTIONS USA

SOURIS RIVER JOINT

WATEFR RFSOURCF
SRF CONSULTING

GROUP
SUNDRE SAND &
GRAVFI . INC
SWANSTON

EQUIPMENT
FONMDANIES

TITAN MACHINERY
UNITED MAILING

SFRVICF
VISIT MINOT

WALLWORK TRUCK

CENTFR
WESTLIE FORD

WESTLIE TRUCK

CENTFR
EMPOWER TRUST

COMPANY. |1 C
EMPOWER TRUST

COMPANY. LI C

MINOT PARK DISTRICT

CENTER FOR PUBLIC
SAFETY

NAANIACENENIT 11O

ND PUBLIC
EMPLOYEES

DETIDENAENIT CVCTEN

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

1ST MINOT MANAGEMENT
BATTEIGER, JOHN
DAKOTA SOUTH CONDO
#14
JOHNSON, COLLEEN R
LOCKE, BRANDON
MIMG CCXXXI COMMONS
SUR.11C
MINOT PARK DISTRICT
PRICE, GARY
SUNDBERG, CLAY

TOWNLEY, PAT

WATTS, ROOSEVELT

Janel Billings Restitution MI-
Fire Alarm Fee for Sanitation
AS400 Technical Support
UB 19984 11 9TH

UB 6848 310 20TH

UB 23184 425 32ND

UB 3166 906 27TH

UB 80976 3425 15TH

UB 98052 1909 31ST

UB 22774 1305 4TH

UB 4650 1008 10TH

UB 86300 79 MULBERRY

UB 16050 722 6TH

UB 4946 507 11TH

Trash Guard 30 Inch
December 2023 Rollkall

MOUNT; UNIVERSAL SANDWICH

MOLUN
SEH DESIGN TXY C/C3

RFCONSTRUC
Signs for street & storm sewer
3529 - FLOOD CONTROL DESGN
MOLUJ

4753 - 16TH ST INTER REHAB TAS
STREET MAINTENANCE - SAND

Duplicate payment on INV P6173

001; CABIN FILTER
POSTAGE & SHIPPING

LODGING TAXES COLLECTED
003; BRAKE DRUM

CONNECTOR
4636 - 4 TANDUM AXLE DUMP
TRUC

Empower Retirement 01/05/2024
Empower Retirement 01/05/2024

Park Mass 01092024

CPSM PUBLIC SAFETY
ASSESSMENT

December 2023 ND PERS
RETIREME

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023
RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023
RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023
RIITIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023
RIITIN

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$375.00
$203.00
$1,160.00
$52.65
$30.95
$157.22
$132.70
$12.87
$168.53
$31.68
$98.72
$16.23
$289.77
$47.69

$26,734.76
$16.00

$130.33
$47,650.00

$33,744.86
$51,495.15

$20,611.15
$13,091.72
$399.88
$38.75
$465.81

$18,172.35
$217.96

$43.09
$361,426.17

$530.70
$130.76
$1,501.45

$32,570.00

$149,760.32

$50.05
$78.18
$502.09
$19.50

$175.69

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

AP168

AP168

AP168

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

AP168

AP168

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

100005016

100005017

100005018

100005019

100005020

100005021

100005022

100005023

100005024

100005025

100005026

100005027

100005028

100005029

100005030

100005032

100005033

100005034

100005035

100005036

100005037

100005038

100005039

100005040

100005041

100005042

100005043

100005044

100005045

100005046

100005047

100005048

100005049

100005050

100005051

100005052

100005053

100005054

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RILTIN

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$70.78
$485.50
$171.60
$1,088.42
$50.05
$699.93
$20.04
$642.84
$298.38
$1,002.04
$22.50
$19.50
$78.82
$506.93
$51.11
$64.01
$20.04
$19.50
$50.05
$47.80
$22.69
$6,837.57
$17.11
$27.20
$170.62
$7.25
$58.68
$24.62
$163.64
$59.48
$17.70
$236.50
$7.25
$183.67
$102.32
$284.90
$7.25

$27.20

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



01/16/2024

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP168

AP167

AP167

AP167

WIRE_002

AP167

WIRE_002

AP167

WIRE_002

AP167

AP167

AP167

AP167

AP167

WIRE_002

AP167

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

AP167

AP167

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_001

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

100005055

100005056

100005057

100005058

100005059

100005060

100005061

100005062

100005063

100005031

100004962

100004963

100004964

100004965

100004966

100004967

100004968

100004972

100004973

100004974

100004975

100004976

100004977

100004978

100004979

100004980

100004981

100004982

100004983

100004984

100004985

100004986

100004987

100004988

100004989

100004990

100004991

100004992

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RILTIN

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$171.82
$17.82
$23.37
$7.25
$17.11
$17.11
$8.42
$2,293.15
$7.25
$75.22
$2,334.99
$243.16
$248.39
$4,737.25
$100.64
$32,084.49
$456.01
$39,392.74
$32,427.64
$3,474.75
$10,091.42
$129.01
$8,762.92
$625.23
$3,598.08
$23.19
$152.37
$119.85
$268.28
$342.68
$1,741.28
$1,580.16
$223.46
$28.53
$145.56
$1,844.03
$46.18

$4,421.43

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



01/18/2024

01/19/2024

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

AP167

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_002

WIRE_002

AFLC1223
V011724

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924

V011924
V011924

100004993

100004994

100004995

100004996

100004997

100004998

100004999

100005001

100005002

100005003

100005004

100005005

100005006

100005007

100005008

100005009

100005010

100004961
299380

299381

299382
299383

299384

299385

299386

299388

299389

299390

299391

299392

299393

299394

299395

299396
299397

299398

299400

299399

299473

299401
299402

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

XCEL

AFLAC
FIRST WESTERN

INSURANCF
ACKERMAN ESTVOLD

ACME TOOLS
ADVANCED BUSINESS

MFTHODS
AMERICAN TRUCK &

TRAIIFR.I1C
APEX ENGINEERING

GROUP
ARAMARK

AZTECA SYSTEMS, LLC

BAG, LLC

BARR ENGINEERING

BISMARCK EVENT

CENTFR
BMI GENERAL
I ICENSING
BRIGHTLY SOFTWARE,

INC
BUTLER MACHINERY

cO
C&C PLUMBING AND

HFATING
CALLYO 2009 CORP

CAROLINA SOFTWARE

CDM SMITH
CENTER FOR PUBLIC
SAFETY

NAANIACENENIT 11O

CENTRAL TRENCHING,

INC
CITY OF MINOT

DACOTAH PAPER CO.
DAKOTA FIRE
FXTINGUISHFR

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RILTIN
December 2023 AFLAC

CYBER SECURITY INSURANCE

2024 EDISON SRTS EASEMENT

ACOU
FUEL FILLER CAP

2023-2028 COPIER AGREEMENT
018; SNOWPLOW FLAGS

16TH ST SW RECONSTRUCTION

APFX
ARAMARK - FLOOR MAT

CIFANING
4423 - CITYWIDE ASSET

MANAGFMN
MONTHLY NORTH SENTRY

CHARGF FO
4618.1 BARR ENG LITTLE

ROOSFVF

Career Fair Electric

2024 Licensing Fee

Maintenance Program Annual Fee
YELLOW PAINT

Troubleshoot Boiler

Callyo
WasteWorks Software Support- 1

CDM SMITH CONTRACT - NDR
CPSM PUBLIC SAFETY
ASSESSMENT

Packer Hydraulic Cylinders tha

Donita Pickett Restitution MI-
Paper 8.5X11 WHT 20LB
AED Pad Replacement

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$4,940.32
$139.65
$16.75
$49.21
$36.80
$3.15
$2,069.97
$514.78
$273.84
$385.51
$0.72
$17.75
$39.74
$54.42
$49.38
$6.84
$655.03

$14,124.37
$37,446.04

$79,847.70

$12,504.62
$8,830.25

$125.20
$104,922.06
$126.18
$109,200.00
$150.00
$1,774.50
$30.00
$435.00
$5,666.93
$169.81
$125.00

$5,628.00
$475.00

$105,842.15
$5,374.04
$4,614.68
$50.00

$8,660.34
$86.36

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00



V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

299403

299404

299405

299406

299407

299408
299409

299410

299411

299412

299413

299414

299415

299416

299417

299418
299419

299420
299422
299423
299424

299425

299426

299427

299428

299429

299430

299431

299432

299433

299434

299435

299436

299437

299438

299439

299440

299441

299442

299443

DAKOTA FLUID

MOTION. I C
DAKOTA FLUID

POWER. INC
DECOMM VENTURES,

P
DEM-CON

COMPANIFS. 11 C
DOMESTIC VIOLENCE

CRISIS CENTFR
DUCKS UNLIMITED

EAPC

EATON CORPORATION

EBSCO
ECOLAB PEST
ELIMINATION

NIN/ICINN

ELDORADO NATIONAL
- CALIFORNIA

ELECTRIC PUMP
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
EMPLOYEE ONE TIME

PAY
ENERBASE

FACTORY MOTOR

PARTS
FARDEN

CONSTRUCTION
FASTENAL COMPANY

FIRE EQUIPMENT CO.
FIRST DISTRICT

HFAITH UNIT
FIRST INTERNATIONAL

BANK & TRUST

FIRST WESTERN

INSURANCF
FLEETMIND

SOIUTIONS. INC
G & P COMMERCIAL

SAIFS
GALE

GALLS, LLC
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY

Hollilynn Bleshe
Jeanny Variste

Maria Romanick

Diedre Postula
Eric Bretheim
FHS PUBLIC SAFETY
FOUNDATION
Kaylee Pontiff

Lisa Schneider

Michaela Young

Minnesota Child Support

Mya Hanson

North Dakota Child Support

North Dakota Child Support

Rodney Brian Neuhalfen
Sharon Samulenok

Tamera Siverston

Fairbanks Morse pump repair
PTO; PUMP

MOT TASK ORDER #1 - MISC
CONSU

Recycling processing- Dec 2023

Crisis Center Fees for Decembe

Invoice # GPRO-DEFINV-2024-17
DOWNTOWN TRANSIT
TRANSFFR FACI

Eaton 9355 UPS - HW Maint 1/1/
Credit on Account CG61010

Rodent Service

BUMPER; HELP BUMPER END
REAR R

GUIDE RING O-RING
Lost badge returned by badgeho

Claim for Mileage Reimbursemen
Reimbursement for Discovery Ce

Fuel 11.861
007; AIR FILTER 6891/88891/P53

Contract Withholding: 300369
013; 3/8 FLATWASHER
Annual Fire Inspection

FIRST DISTRICT HEALTH UNIT SER

Fire Union Due's

Joshua Noyes Notary Bond
January Fleetmind Software Agr
Custodial use Products : bow!
E-Book Subscription

polos for ACOs

Lost Book that patron returned
Lost Book that patron returned
MINOTFD Q2'23 EXCESS FUNDS
Lost Book that patron returned
Donita Pickett Restitution MI-
Richard Graham Restitution MI-
Justin Nelson Restitution MI-2
Kevin Schmidt Restitution MI-2
Ryan Prater Restitution MI-202
Ryan Prater Restitution MI-202
Justin Hoiland Restitution MI-
Lost Book that patron returned

Adrianna Herrera Restitution M

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$12,578.44
$923.41
$6,075.00
$1,806.49
$1,250.45

$19,440.00
$20,233.62

$5,355.42
$2,336.47
$119.49
$405.65
$83.54
$20.00
$48.99
$50.00

$57,891.69
$245.54

$9,556.85
$4.30
$926.00
$26,500.00

$759.00

$50.00
$1,987.50
$404.24
$150.00
$516.68
$18.99
$36.94
$960.00
$10.99
$50.00
$50.00
$10.00
$200.00
$250.00
$25.00
$50.00
$8.99

$25.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

299444
299445
299446
299447
299448
299449
299450

299451

299452

299453

299454

299455

299456

299457

299458
299459

299460

299461

299462

299464

299465

299466

299474

299467

299468

299469

299463

299470

299471
299472

299475

299476

299477

299478

299479

299480

299481
299482

299483

299484

299485
299486

299487

GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL ONE TIME

PAY
GENERAL TRADING

GERDAU RECYCLING
GRAINGER
GRAYMONT WESTERN

USINC
HIGH POINT
NFTWORKS. 1 C
HOGAN

MANUFACTURING, INC

HOUSTON

FNGINFFRING. INC
IMSA

INTERNATIONAL CITY
MANAGEMENT

ACCNCIATINN DET

INTERSTATE BATTERY

SYSTEM
INTERSTATE

FNGINFFRING. INC
JIMS WELDING, INC.

JLG ARCHITECTS
KIMBALL MIDWEST

KLJ ENGINEERING, LLC

LEADSONLINE
M-B COMPANIES, INC
MAD DOG

RROKFRAGF INC
MAIN ELECTRIC
CONSTRUCTION
MARCO, INC.
MELANIE MOORE
MICROMARKETING LLC

MID-STATES
ORGANIZED CRIME

INIEN FTD

MIDWEST TAPE
MINOT AREA

CHAMREFR FDC
MINOT COMMISSION

ON AGING
MINOT DAILY NEWS

MINOT EMPLOYEE

DONATIONS
MOWBRAY & SONS

NAPA AUTO PARTS
ND DEPT OF

TRANSPORTATION
ND DEPT OF WATER

RFSOURCES
ND FRATERNAL

ORDFR OF POIICF
NEWMAN TRAFFIC

SIGNS
NORTHERN TESTING

NORTHWEST TIRE

AND RFTRFAD
NORTHWESTERN

POWER EQUIPMENT C

NOVA FIRE

PROTFCTION CO
OLSON'S TOWING

ONE CALL CONCEPTS,

INC
ONLINE DAKOTA

INFORMATION

NIET\A/NDY

Teresa Hunt

Vicky L. Geyer-Panasuk

Alexander Pittenger Restitutio
Lynette Burtch Restitution MI-

Drill bit

STEEL; STEEL AS NEEDED
LATCH; 1/4 TWIST LATCH ASSY
2023 Lime purchase

Block of High Point Support Ho

SERVICE; ELECTRICAL-MINIFUSE

4618 - LOW HEAD DAM

REMEDIATIO
2024 membership for the whole
City manager pension

--; AAA BATTERY
Independent Fee Analysis for W
Repair aluminum bus mirror mou

JLG ARCHITECTS - NDR
007; HEATON PUMPS SHRINK

TURIN
4398 - CITY HALL RETAINING WAL

LeadsOnline Service
Unit 327/328 wheel caster hub
66.74 Tons of Salt

Unhooked & removed pumps @
Per

Customer Payoff Invoice
Accounting civil service exam
Audio Books

MOCIC Membership fee

Children's DVDs
MACEDC SERVICE AGREEMENT

2024
COMMISSION ON AGING SERVICE

AG
Minot Daily News Paper
Minot Employee Donations

Toilet not working at library
MEF655 DRAG LINK
4724 - NHU-SU-4-002(141)149 PC

3210.07 - NAWS 7-1B MINOT
WATF
Police Union Due's/ Legal Defe

Anchor 4' x 2.25" - Telespar -

Drug test panel, DOT
Tire Repair on Unit 43

16th ST Closure

Replaced and serviced system

PD TOWING CONTRACT
December 2023 One Call tickets

Databases

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$25.00
$378.55
$702.17
$580.32
$23.18
$20,664.60
$7,603.05

$146.00

$85,018.78
$510.00
$624.56
$8.34
$3,500.00
$375.41

$620.00
$23.60

$12,715.50
$5,866.00
$1,337.22
$6,733.40
$25,068.12
$1,256.63
$210.00
$27.99
$250.00
$84.22
$121,637.50

$12,875.00

$260.00
$818.96

$1,061.08
$2,064.12
$7,028.85
$255,477.20
$1,539.00
$1,289.28

$490.00
$10,646.79

$10,346.09

$1,643.00

$1,365.00
$131.90

$316.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



01/22/2024
01/23/2024

01/24/2024

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924
V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924
V011924

V011924

V011924

AP166
PM012324

J0012424

AP168

AP168

AP168

AP168

299421

299488

299387
299489

299490

299491
299492

299493

299494

299495

299496

299497

299498

299499
299500

299501

299502

299503

299504

299505

299506
299507
299508
299509
299510

299511
299512

299513

299514
299515

299516
299517

299518

299519

100004955
100005064

299520

100005071

100005073

100005075

100005078

PARKLAND USA

CORPORATION
PATRIOT FIRE &

SAFFTY INC
PEC SOLUTIONS LLC

PRAIRIE SUPPLY

PRINGLE &

HFRIGSTAD. P.C
PROCOLLECT

PROTECH

INTFGRATIONS. 11 C
PROVIDENT LIFE &

ACC INS CO
RAFTELIS FINANCIAL

CONSUITANTS. INC
ROERS

CONSTRUCTION
SANITATION

PRODUCTS
SERTOMA CLUB OF

MINOT
SHORT ELLIOTT

HENDRICKSON. INC
SIGN SOLUTIONS USA

SOLTIS BUSINESS

FORMS CO
SOURIS RIVER JOINT

WATEFR RFSOURCF
SRF CONSULTING

GROUP
SWANSON &
WARCUP.ITD

SWANSTON

EQUIPMENT
FONMDANIES

THOMSON REUTERS-
WEST PAYMENT

CENITED

TIMMONS GROUP

TITAN MACHINERY
TOLLEFSON'S
TRITECH SOFTWARE

SYSTFEMS
TYLER TECHNOLOGIES,

INC
ULINE

UNITED MAILING

SFRVICF
UNUM LIFE

INSURANCF
VERIZON WIRELESS

VESSCO, INC.

VISIT MINOT
WARD COUNTY

RFCORDFR
WARD COUNTY

RFCORDFR
WESTLIE TRUCK

CENTFR
VERENDRYE ELECTRIC
MINOT PARK DISTRICT
CRAFT BUILDERS, INC.

MDU
MDU
MDU

MDU

Purchasing diesel exhaust flui
Drain Valve for Unit #238

12/11/2023 services
CUT-OFF WHEEL, 4-1/2X.045X7/8

VOID AFTER UPDATE 01/19/2024

PROCOLLECT
Monthly Fire Alarm Fee - Paid

DECEMBER 2023 PREMIUM

PAYMENT
Raftelis Contract for Strategi

Contract Withholding: 300429
015; CONVEYOR BELT 1082386
4th Quarter Dues 2023

SEH CFME ENGINEERING &

ACOUISI
Center Turn Lane Sign Installa
7 Winter Coats

3529.8 - DL BARKIE

CONSTRUCTIO
4753 - 16TH ST INTER REHAB TAS

SWANSON & WARCUP

CONTRACT - ND
BREAKER; CIRCUIT BREAKER ASSY

January 2024 Services

4705 - CITYWORKS AND GIS
SUPPO

Frost Breaker/Impactor
Underlayment and repair

911 GIS Data Maintenance - Pay

NWPS - 2024 CAD CFS (xml) Inte

Dust mop kit 36"
POSTAGE/SHIPPING (December

nor

DECEMBER UNUM LIFE PREMIUM

Nov 24- Dec 23 Verizon Bill Ci
W MARLOW,LEAK DETECTOR

FIOAT S
LODGING TAXES COLLECTED

Lien Release
Lien Release
Belt, V RIB

DECEMBER VERENDRYE BILL
Park Mass 01.23.2024

Carnegie Center ADA Compliance

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RIITIN
DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023

RILTIN

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$4,478.10
$754.80

$966.00
$283.86

$0.00

$318.92
$425.00

$363.08
$5,000.00
$12,000.00
$4,798.00
$375.00
$42,625.00

$6,011.00
$824.00

$2,224,833.61
$56,178.28
$393.00

$424.48

$372.00

$7,788.75
$10,250.00
$383.00
$4,813.40
$2,352.00

$64.50
$400.70

$13,228.06

$111.82
$836.24

$26,274.43
$20.00

$20.00
$943.18

$67,693.41
$1,543.66

$21,832.00
$134.00
$476.47
$4,649.85

$15.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$142.50

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00



01/25/2024

AP168

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

WIRE_001

J0012424

J0012424

DC010523

DC122223

WEX0124

100005079

100005080

100005081

100005084

100005085

100005086

100005087

100005088

100005089

100005091

100005092

100005093

100005094

100005095

100005096

100005097

100005099

100005101

100005104

100005105

100005106

100005107

100005111

100005112

100005113

100005114

100005115

100005117

100005118

100005119

100005120

100005121

100005122

299521

299522

100005065

100005066

100004969

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

MDU

PROJECT BEE

UNUM LIFE

INSURANCF
ND PUBLIC

EMPLOYEES
DECTIDENENIT CVCTENA
ND PUBLIC
EMPLOYEES

DETIDENAENIT CVCTEN

WEX HEALTH, INC

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $83.33

BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $368.05
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $2,277.00
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $645.94
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $12.00
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $82.95
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $12.00
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $15.00
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $370.67
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $15.00
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $56.58
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $199.96
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $69.19
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $639.16
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $940.36
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $119.15
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $421.01
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $4,068.01
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $13.60
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $76.29
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2024 $482.08
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $1,994.38
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $17.22
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $75.89
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $17.22
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $14.50
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $486.54
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $14.50
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $51.11
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $178.48
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $62.60
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $562.92
BILTIN

DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $1,225.29
BILTIN

BROADWAY CIRCLE - LMI $559,622.39
HOUSING

NOVEMBER UNMUM LTD POLICY $8,396.12
041

Def Comp 01.05.2024 $12,673.45
Def Comp 12.22.2023 $12,319.36
December 2023 WEX/FSA $256.20

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00



01/26/2024 AP167 100005124 XCEL DECEMBER STATEMENT/2023 $59.70 $0.00
RIITIN
$5,923,213.90 $560,056.89

2/1/2024 8:45:10 AM



Posting date

12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023
12/29/2023

1/2/2024

1/2/2024

1/2/2024

Transaction date

12/26/2023
12/26/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/27/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023
12/28/2023

Supplier

Amzn Mktp Us

Best Buy 00010637
Usps Po 3762880701
Home Of Economy-#4
Acme Rents Minot
Acme Rents Minot
Acme Rents Minot

Panasonic Connect North A

Att

Amzn Mktp Us

Sp Fabric Sign Guys
Fmcsa D&a Clearinghouse
At&t Payment

At&t Payment

Overhead Door Company Of

Dakota Fluid Power, Inc.
Cenex Express 09907437
Napa Parts 0027632
Carquest Auto

Rhi Supply Minot
Fedex788577992545

A La Mode, Lic

Mn Vly Testing Labs
Adobe *acropro Subs
Acme Tools Minot
Home Of Economy-#4
Lowes Printing

Home Of Economy-#4
Harbor Freight Tools3246
Lowes Printing

Controls Central
Dacotah Paper Co

Eb 2024 Nd Operator T
Scheels Minot
Blackstonelibrary.Com
Esri

Adobe *acropro Subs
Batteries Plus #0639
Minot Area Chamber
Amzn Mktp Us

Amzn Mktp Us

Amzn Mktp Us

Amzn Mktp Us

Butler Machinery Company

Napa Parts 0027632
The Home Depot #3703

Amount
190.52
24.17
18.54
314.99
(645.00)
645.00
800.00
60.00
50.96
38.83
579.00
25.00
275.52
407.68
121.10
(50.43)
27.14
6.53
1,055.04
107.48
42.69
1,047.00
466.40
21.49
103.98
35.00
724.00
23.99
72.99
353.55
285.64
239.82
225.00
2,424.85
34.94
1,790.00
21.49
147.22
150.00
13.98
424.95
109.98
710.48
215.34
218.05
9.96



1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/2/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024

12/28/2023 Menards Minot Nd
12/28/2023 Menards Minot Nd
12/28/2023 Clareys Safety Equipment
12/28/2023 Gaffaneys
12/28/2023 Menards Minot Nd
12/29/2023 Westlie Truck Center - Mi
12/29/2023 Acme Tools Minot
12/29/2023 Paypal
12/29/2023 Minot Restaurant Supply
12/29/2023 Srt Communications, Inc
12/29/2023 Srt Communications, Inc
12/29/2023 Srt Communications, Inc
12/29/2023 Galls
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Amzn Mktp Us
12/29/2023 Main Electric Constructn
12/29/2023 Main Electric Constructn
12/29/2023 Main Electric Constructn
12/30/2023 Autopay/Dish Ntwk
12/30/2023 Lawson Products
12/30/2023 Oreilly 1537
12/30/2023 Amzn Mktp Us

1/1/2024 Ck Holiday # 06431

1/2/2024 All American Trophies & S

1/2/2024 State Bar North Dakota

1/2/2024 Batteries Plus #0639

1/2/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/2/2024 Mp-*minot Afb Club

1/2/2024 At&t Payment

1/2/2024 Scheels Minot

1/2/2024 Electric Pump- Inc.

1/2/2024 Home Of Economy-#4

1/2/2024 Dakota Supply Group - Bis

1/2/2024 Core & Main - Nd002

1/2/2024 Government Finance Offic

1/2/2024 Amazon.Com*paOwq6vz3

1/2/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/2/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/2/2024 Amazon.Com*sr60m1r63

1/2/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/2/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt

1/3/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt

202.32
27.50
1,564.75
51.25
925.78
518.12
(14.99)
75.00
885.00
671.21
9,279.32
958.56
66.42
136.62
20.44
453.00
9.48
21.95
15.99
402.00
1,614.51
500.00
202.10
137.86
46.69
14.51
225.00
31.00
20.00
38.90
71.69
13.71
193.76
74.94
5,197.78
329.98
2,047.58
161.54
150.00
27.14
28.52
993.15
86.38
14.36
1,551.91
226.87
1,588.09



1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/3/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024

1/3/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/3/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/2/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/2/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/2/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/2/2024 Office Depot #1090
1/2/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/2/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/2/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/2/2024 North Prairie Rural Wate
1/2/2024 Main Electric Constructn
1/2/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/2/2024 Fedex788781948422
1/2/2024 Apco International Inc
1/2/2024 Nena

1/2/2024 Network Fleet, Inc.
1/3/2024 Www.Nchsoftware.Com
1/3/2024

1/3/2024 Grainger

1/3/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/3/2024 Northwest Tire #4 Minot T
1/3/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/3/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/3/2024 Priceln*united Airline
1/3/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/3/2024 Magic City Car Wash
1/3/2024 Muus Lumber And Hardware-
1/3/2024 Overhead Door Company Of
1/3/2024 Www.Amazon* 114-583055
1/3/2024 Macs Minot, Nd

1/3/2024 Macs Minot, Nd

1/3/2024 Vacuum & Sewing Center Of
1/3/2024 In *preferred Controls In
1/3/2024 Propper E-Commerce, Inc.
1/3/2024 North Dakota State Uni
1/3/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/3/2024 Fedex

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Enerbase 09895657
1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/3/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

226.87
680.61
58.84
35.16
108.78
23.94
109.37
105.89
44.70
70.39
54.71
602.98
44.85
46.55
79.00
147.00
476.13
70.61
0.71
749.46
139.99
13,048.68
200.00
174.99
32.00
174.99
350.00
29.46
37.26
499.75
113.32
(46.36)
119.95
797.50
224.94
75.00
329.98
19.35
1,785.79
171.11
35.35
56.86
25.23
29.95
539.48
56.94
108.74



1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/4/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/5/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024

1/3/2024 Nd Environmental Quali
1/3/2024 Nd Dept Of Environment
1/4/2024 Intl Code Council
1/4/2024 Pitney Bowes Pi
1/3/2024 Zoro Tools Inc

1/3/2024 United

1/3/2024 United

1/3/2024 United

1/3/2024 laai

1/3/2024 United

1/3/2024 United

1/3/2024 Office Depot #1214
1/3/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/3/2024 All Safe Industries
1/3/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/3/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/3/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/4/2024 Aed.Us_coro Medical
1/4/2024 Apple.Com/Bill
1/4/2024 Planet Hollywd Adv Depo
1/4/2024 Dakota Fluid Power, Inc.
1/4/2024 Paypal

1/4/2024 The Ups Store 1423
1/4/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/4/2024 Column Public Notice
1/4/2024 Tlo Transunion

1/4/2024 Harbor Freight Tools3246
1/4/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/4/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/4/2024 Column Public Notice
1/4/2024 Lowes Printing
1/4/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/4/2024 Community Transportation
1/4/2024 Cdl School Online
1/4/2024 American Association O
1/4/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/5/2024 Intl Code Council
1/5/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/5/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/4/2024 Allegnt Air,i7j

1/4/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/4/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/4/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/4/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/4/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/4/2024 Rhi Supply Minot

1.25
50.00
600.00
82.98
379.99
16.00
16.00
16.00
853.00
558.23
16.00
81.95
89.74
917.01
272.25
79.52
36.99
416.03
5.36
163.27
115.23
1,081.50
81.00
260.00
283.14
160.80
69.99
200.00
200.00
84.24
198.45
57.74
775.00
89.00
1,670.00
23.04
750.00
453.74
5,220.00
120.14
342.60
44.27
135.94
271.73

(79.00)

(272.25)
264.44



1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/8/2024
1/9/2024
1/9/2024
1/9/2024

1/4/2024 West Oaks Animal Hospital
1/4/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/5/2024 Enerbase 09895632
1/5/2024 Adobe *acropro Subs
1/5/2024 Sq *florida Hazardous Mat
1/5/2024 Prairie Supply Inc
1/5/2024 Carquest Auto

1/5/2024 Orleans Hotel & Casino
1/5/2024 Delta Air

1/5/2024 Delta Air

1/5/2024 Power Process Equip 3611
1/5/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/5/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/5/2024 Nd Dept Of Environment
1/5/2024 Nd Environmental Quali
1/5/2024 Tractor-Supply-Co #0130
1/5/2024 Nd Dept Of Environment
1/5/2024 Nd Environmental Quali
1/5/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/5/2024 Sp Sweepscrub.Com
1/5/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/5/2024 Petco.Com 6989
1/5/2024 Paypal

1/5/2024 Hach Company

1/5/2024 Home Of Economy-#4

1/5/2024 Bismarck Mandan Chamber E

1/5/2024 Galls

1/5/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/5/2024 Fastenal Company 01ndmin
1/5/2024 Escapepointnd.Com
1/5/2024 Fastenal Company 01ndmin
1/5/2024 Fedex

1/5/2024 Fedex788932659304
1/5/2024 Information System
1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/5/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/6/2024 National Registry Emt
1/6/2024 North Dakota Library A
1/6/2024 Blackstonelibrary.Com
1/6/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/7/2024 Costco Whse#1380
1/7/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/8/2024 All American Trophies & S
1/8/2024 Maritz At&I* Ala

3,602.38
44.85
26.88
21.49

225.00
130.00
89.97
58.76
30.00
30.00

1,302.60
13.68
39.84
50.00

1.25
36.38
50.00

1.25
85.96

109.84
169.78
44.06
55.00
130.05
139.99
450.00
207.39
239.25
77.49
58.00
31.21
78.59
11.45
10,216.00

1,455.03
16.97
55.30
22.61
28.69
25.00
35.00
73.90

453.74
148.69
19.92
22.00
552.00



1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024

1/9/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024

1/8/2024 Delta Air

1/8/2024 Cenex Harleys 09896960
1/8/2024 Spi*direct Service
1/8/2024 Spi*direct Service
1/8/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/8/2024 Linde Gas & Equipment Inc
1/8/2024 Alien Gear Holsters
1/8/2024 Vistaprint Corporate Solu
1/8/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/9/2024 Kaminsky,sullenberger
1/9/2024 Allianz Travel Ins
1/9/2024 Intl Code Council
1/9/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

12/19/2023 Zoro Tools Inc

1/8/2024 Ha Thompson & Sons
1/8/2024 lacp

1/8/2024 Demco Inc

1/8/2024 Awg 2557

1/8/2024 Eggers Electric Motor
1/8/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/8/2024 Minaf Outdoor Rec
1/8/2024 West Oaks Animal Hospital
1/8/2024 North Prairie Rural Wate
1/8/2024 Carquest Auto

1/8/2024 Allegnt Air,dnq
1/8/2024 Fedex789043180132
1/8/2024 Softchoice Corporation
1/9/2024 Tractor-Supply-Co #0130
1/9/2024 Verizonwrlss

1/9/2024 Office Furniture Resou
1/9/2024 470 Auto Value - Minot
1/9/2024 Bestbuycom806903113831
1/9/2024 Delta Air

1/9/2024 Calendly

1/9/2024 Delta Air

1/9/2024 Sp Firestationfurnit
1/9/2024 Www.lafc.Org

1/9/2024 Delta Air

1/9/2024 Border States Industries
1/9/2024 Delta Air

1/9/2024 Delta Air

1/9/2024 Walmart.Com

1/9/2024 Enerbase 09895657
1/9/2024 Enerbase 09895632
1/9/2024 Walmart.Com

1/9/2024 Amazon.Com*tk2gt3uh2
1/9/2024 Harbor Freight Tools3246

611.20
260.00
147.99
157.98
44.99
47.56
60.57
56.24
16.60
400.00
41.26
1,000.00
83.70
881.30
1,520.00
475.00
946.40
519.75
150.44
49.50
250.00
25.00
119.46
199.16
445.00
11.45
291.51
89.99
212.45
285.00
419.70
549.99
995.20
126.18
995.20
5,099.93
240.00
995.20
2,350.55
995.20
995.20
26.48
89.74
103.38
21.68
129.99
343.93



1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/10/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024

1/9/2024 Orleans Hotel & Casino
1/9/2024 Core & Main - Nd002
1/9/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/9/2024 Cdl School Online
1/9/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/9/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/9/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/9/2024 Cdw Govt #nx08054
1/9/2024 World Trade Press Llc
1/9/2024 Ssp*lewisclarktrailherit
1/10/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/10/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/10/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/10/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/10/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/9/2024 Bound Tree Medical Llc
1/9/2024 lacp
1/9/2024 Fire Safety Usa Inc
1/9/2024 Nj Criminal
1/9/2024 lacp
1/9/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/9/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/9/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/9/2024 Shell 0il10083966019
1/9/2024 lacp
1/9/2024 lacp
1/9/2024 Marketplace Foods S
1/9/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/10/2024 Enerbase 09895632
1/10/2024 Planet Pizza
1/10/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/10/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/10/2024 Uofl Spi
1/10/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/10/2024 Hulu 877-8244858 Ca
1/10/2024 Amazon.Com*tk6d27uql
1/10/2024 The Ups Store 1423
1/10/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/10/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/10/2024 Www Costco Com
1/10/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/10/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/10/2024 At&t Payment
1/10/2024 At&t Payment
1/10/2024 Information Today
1/10/2024 Delta Air
1/10/2024 Allianz Travel Ins

126.11
2,011.28
226.52
89.00
25.14
189.95
6.50
99.45
548.65
65.00
1,321.50
1,167.91
1,321.50
1,245.09
680.61
336.62
475.00
112.00
225.00
475.00
144.00
5.96
7.64
26.51
475.00
475.00
335.16
289.88
941.05
51.75
91.99
91.99
850.00
19.26
86.98
217.47
283.83
11.99
39.79
77.43
15291
33.97
439.71
305.82
589.00
875.20
61.26



1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/11/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/12/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024

1/10/2024 Galls

1/10/2024 Wm Supercenter #1636
1/10/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/11/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/10/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/10/2024 Dmv Arrowhead Shopping C
1/10/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/10/2024 Bound Tree Medical Llc
1/10/2024 Bound Tree Medical Llc
1/10/2024 United

1/10/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/10/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/11/2024 Harbor Freight Tools3246
1/11/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/11/2024 Kfyr

1/11/2024 Sq *the Putt District
1/11/2024 Sq *the Bark Porch Inc
1/11/2024 Scheels Minot
1/11/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/11/2024 Hach Company

1/11/2024 Muus Lumber And Hardware-

1/11/2024 Hon*analytics Inc.
1/11/2024 B&h Photo 800-606-6969
1/11/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/11/2024 Macs Minot, Nd
1/11/2024 Municipay*service Fee
1/11/2024 Ndrin *nd Recrds Copy
1/11/2024 Column Public Notice
1/11/2024 Column Public Notice
1/11/2024 Column Public Notice
1/11/2024 Tritech Forensics
1/11/2024 Sigma Aldrich Us
1/11/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/11/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/11/2024 Sq *xgolf Minot- Squarel
1/11/2024 Main Electric Constructn
1/11/2024 At&t Payment
1/11/2024 Batteries Plus #0639
1/11/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/11/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/11/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Intl Code Council
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/11/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/11/2024 Delta Air

1/11/2024 Napa Parts 0027632

75.48
378.00
24.99
4,957.52
255.48
47.00
33.97
144.59
86.37
605.20
48.09
82.14
24.48
(91.99)
1,621.00
50.00
84.00
50.00
13.77
67.89
1,155.74
1,155.00
419.76
31.98
22.99
1.50
30.00
285.48
285.48
18.72
20.07
115.11
14.23
2,225.97
50.00
2,533.42
1,036.99
77.80
119.96
17.95
14.69
600.00
(57.74)
(40.49)
230.03
30.00
173.63



1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024

1/11/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/11/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/11/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/11/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/11/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/11/2024 United

1/11/2024 Softchoice Corporation
1/12/2024 Carquest Auto
1/12/2024 Magic City Garage Door
1/12/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/12/2024 Boot Barn #119
1/12/2024 Boot Barn #119
1/12/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/12/2024 Amz*monoprice
1/12/2024 Morrison-Clark Inn
1/12/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Boot Barn #119
1/12/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/12/2024 Amazon.Com*rt98w4wp0
1/12/2024 Boot Barn #119
1/12/2024 Boot Barn #119
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Grainger

1/12/2024 Prairie Supply Inc
1/12/2024 Lirmi

1/12/2024 Lirmi

1/12/2024 Tfs*fishersci Ecom Hus
1/12/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/12/2024 Rdoce Min 020107
1/12/2024 Core & Main - Nd002
1/12/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/12/2024 Delta Air

1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 National Registry Emt
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/12/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/13/2024 Vzwrlss*apocc Visb
1/13/2024 Tfs*fishersci Ecom Hus
1/13/2024 Galls

1/13/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/13/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/13/2024 Vzwrlss*apocc Visb
1/13/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/13/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/13/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt

20.87
40.78
(25.48)
75.67
60.35
534.20
46.47
60.06
161.50
1,437.99
179.99
174.99
200.00
188.90
1,592.46
110.14
49.99
179.99
(12.87)
48.62
184.99
184.99
57.00
118.30
409.50
150.00
150.00
28.95
68.68
330.23
600.00
50.97
732.20
48.58
25.00
29.99
15.99
103.49
40.01
51.16
86.90
36.98
145.73
3,358.78
2,335.82
3,503.73
2,335.82



1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/15/2024
1/16/2024
1/16/2024
1/16/2024
1/16/2024
1/16/2024
1/16/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/17/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024
1/18/2024

1/13/2024 Canon Direct

1/13/2024 Scheels Minot

1/14/2024 Zoom.Us 888-799-9666
1/14/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/14/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/15/2024 Adobe *stock

1/15/2024 Amazon.Com*rt9ixOvul
1/15/2024 Delta Air

1/15/2024 Walmart.Com

1/15/2024 Vzwrlss*apocc Visb
1/15/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/15/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/16/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/15/2024 The Starving R12800025
1/15/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/15/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/16/2024 Batteries Plus #0639
1/16/2024 Ndspls* 2023 Ndspl
1/16/2024 In *dakota Fire Extinguis
1/16/2024 Tfs*fishersci Ecom Hus
1/16/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/16/2024 Galls

1/16/2024 Dxp Enterprises
1/16/2024 In *dakota Fire Extinguis
1/16/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/16/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/16/2024 Eb 2024 Nddegndwpcc
1/16/2024 Animal Care Equipment &
1/16/2024 Quadient Leasing Usa P
1/16/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/16/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/17/2024 Intl Code Council
1/17/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/16/2024 Daytona Grande Hotel
1/16/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/16/2024 Apco International Inc
1/17/2024 Charlies Main Street Caf
1/17/2024 Vzwrlss*apocc Visb
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance
1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance

1,208.60
390.89
15.99
26.45
14.57
29.99
49.99
30.00
400.99
440.21
54.99
17.08
4,547.66
39.00
75.99
81.69
15.26
450.50
111.25
100.96
463.99
69.16
28.52
734.92
200.00
200.00
23.18
526.11
1,279.23
19.69
145.99
600.00
99.00
1,207.00
17.99
972.00
50.46
337.44
1,593.00
1,745.00
2,763.00
1,004.00
1,514.00
4,009.00
3,261.00
2,410.00
1,116.00



1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 3,407.00

1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 2,105.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 At&t Payment 91.88
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Firepenny 2,783.62
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Tractor-Supply-Co #0130 23.47
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Minot Restaurant Supply 63.50
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Macs Minot, Nd 87.83
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 General Trading Company 110.86
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Nd Safety Council 320.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Nd Environmental Quali 1.25
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Nd Dept Of Environment 50.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 North Country Sports 12.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 North Country Sports 24.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 North Country Sports 36.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Home Of Economy-#4 199.99
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Amzn Mktp Us 66.74
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Amazon.Com*r882a9fe2 49.99
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Baker-Taylor 49.58
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Pb Leasing 243.93
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Baker-Taylor 314.05
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Amazon.Com*r89zb5dr0 15.00
1/18/2024 1/17/2024 Amzn Mktp Us 59.98
1/18/2024 1/18/2024 Amzn Mktp Us 22.99
1/18/2024 1/18/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt 3,964.50
1/19/2024 1/17/2024 Menards Minot Nd 124.79
1/19/2024 1/17/2024 Carquest Auto 142.92
1/19/2024 1/17/2024 Cenex Tri Ener09909771 33.78
1/19/2024 1/17/2024 Homedepot.Com 30.51
1/19/2024 1/17/2024 Menards Minot Nd 140.57
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Lowes Printing 236.35
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Amazon.Com*r86y15ie0 359.99
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Amazon.Com*r862d0z12 76.40
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 1,219.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 874.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 716.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 974.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 1,089.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 646.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 926.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Fema Nfip Flood Insurance 1,522.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Acme Tools Minot 24.08
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Delta Air 30.00
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Acme Tools Minot 3.91
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Batteries Plus #0639 63.36
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se 19.50
1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Verizonwrlss 71.81

1/19/2024 1/18/2024 Column Public Notice 478.92



1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/19/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024

1/18/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/18/2024 Column Public Notice
1/18/2024 Mn Vly Testing Labs
1/18/2024 Arrowhead Ace
1/18/2024 Sigma Aldrich Us
1/18/2024 Overdrive Dist

1/18/2024 Overdrive Dist

1/18/2024 Amazon Ret* Employee R
1/18/2024 Macs Minot, Nd
1/18/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/18/2024 Animal Care Equipment &
1/18/2024 Column Public Notice
1/18/2024 Delta Air

1/18/2024 American Planning A
1/18/2024 Orleans Hotel & Casino
1/18/2024 Orleans Hotel & Casino
1/18/2024 Market Shar

1/18/2024 Market Shar

1/18/2024 Continental Metal Product
1/18/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/18/2024 Harbor Freight Tools3246
1/18/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/18/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/18/2024 Amazon Ret* 113-466116
1/18/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/18/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/19/2024 North Dakota Aviation
10/4/2023 Dispute-Hotel Dossier F&b
1/18/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/18/2024 M&h #25

1/18/2024 The Home Depot 3703
1/18/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/18/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/18/2024 Holiday Inn Express Hote
1/18/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/19/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/19/2024 Delta Air

1/19/2024 Budget Rent A Car
1/19/2024 National Registry Emt
1/19/2024 Rdoce Min 020107
1/19/2024 West Oaks Animal Hospital
1/19/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/19/2024 Cenex Max Farm09885773
1/19/2024 Core & Main - Nd002
1/19/2024 Holiday Stations 0446
1/19/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/19/2024 Menards Minot Nd

149.95
85.80
7,039.00
54.99
68.37
352.10
1,477.13
54.40
129.44
227.94
(53.20)
85.80
476.20
830.00
58.76
(126.11)
64.23
263.60
287.00
69.94
124.95
164.97
49.94
27.98
624.10
380.14
40.00
(27.00)
162.10
8.13
317.20
31.49
34.55
217.40
106.66
16.98
30.00
438.74
25.00
187.90
314.66
91.82
32.16
13,896.00
31.23
105.50
9.19



1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/22/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/23/2024

1/19/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/19/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/20/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/20/2024 Walmart.Com
1/20/2024 Nd Ems Association
1/20/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/21/2024 Nd Dept Of Environment
1/21/2024 Nd Environmental Quali
1/21/2024 One9 1224

1/21/2024 Sq *national Tactical Off
1/21/2024 Sams Club #4933
1/21/2024 Nd Secretary Of State
1/21/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/21/2024 Marketplace Foods
1/21/2024 Hampton Inns
1/21/2024 Hampton Inns
1/21/2024 Cenex Enerbase09907452
1/22/2024 Etsy, Inc.

1/22/2024 Adobe Inc.

1/22/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/22/2024 4imprint, Inc

1/22/2024 Att

1/22/2024 Minot Area Chamber
1/22/2024 Att

1/22/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/22/2024 At&t Payment
1/22/2024 Northeast K9 Condition
1/22/2024 Target 00000851
1/22/2024 Allianz Travel Ins
1/22/2024 Tyler User Conference
1/22/2024 Delta Air

1/22/2024 Delta Air

1/22/2024 Core & Main - Nd002
1/22/2024 Ferguson Entprs 3094
1/22/2024 North Country Sports

1/22/2024 Hawthorn Suites By Wyndha

1/22/2024 North Country Sports
1/22/2024 Macs Minot, Nd
1/22/2024 At&t Payment
1/22/2024 Delta Air

1/22/2024 Delta Air

1/22/2024 Allianz Travel Ins
1/22/2024 Tyler User Conference
1/22/2024 At&t Payment
1/23/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/23/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/23/2024 Nd Wsi

49.79
71.95
51.98
59.66
190.00
675.58
50.00
1.25
26.96
450.00
111.14
36.00
179.99
62.97
167.00
167.00
15.21
70.19
21.49
29.11
3,980.79
275.64
150.00
50.96
24.95
193.82
97.00
66.63
48.80
1,199.00
857.20
29.99
187.36
385.58
18.50
106.24
104.00
125.98
407.76
29.99
857.20
48.80
1,199.00
450.44
273.82
62.18
350.00



1/23/2024
1/23/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/24/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024

1/23/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/23/2024 Dmi* Dell K-12/Govt
1/22/2024 Jimmy Johns - 1208 - E
1/22/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/22/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/22/2024 American Association O
1/22/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/22/2024 Paypa

1/22/2024 Paypal

1/22/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/22/2024 Rhi Supply Minot
1/22/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/22/2024 Wm Supercenter #1636
1/22/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/23/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/23/2024 Atssa-Expo

1/23/2024 Tyler User Conference
1/23/2024 Tmg Business Services
1/23/2024 Fire Safety Usa Inc
1/23/2024 Fire Safety Usa Inc
1/23/2024 Fire Safety Usa Inc

1/23/2024 Muus Lumber And Hardware-

1/23/2024 Column Public Notice
1/23/2024 Sp Tonies Us

1/23/2024 Harbor Freight Tools3246

1/23/2024 Grainger
1/23/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/23/2024 Macs Minot, Nd

1/23/2024 Pp*sabrina&apos S Creatio

1/23/2024 Amazon.Com*r01118500
1/23/2024 Atssa-Expo

1/23/2024 Vistaprint Corporate Solu
1/23/2024 Atssa-Expo

1/23/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/22/2024 Delta Air

1/23/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/23/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/23/2024 Arco Luckys

1/23/2024 Carquest Auto
1/23/2024 Prairie Supply Inc
1/23/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/24/2024 North Dakota State Uni
1/24/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/24/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/24/2024 Misu-Nelnet

1/24/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/24/2024 Grainger

5,011.27
3,870.22
63.13
7.75
119.76
275.00
30.98
150.00
150.00
38.27
47.85
6.98
(378.00)
49.97
89.97
195.00
2,398.00
209.25
300.00
2,799.00
297.00
17.99
33.54
1,711.54
57.96
301.56
1,304.24
164.50
20.00
87.52
195.00
320.56
195.00
33.26
527.20
158.83
20.37
27.30
146.71
343.57
42.99
75.00
49.99
45.80
352.10
37.99
45.00



1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/25/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/26/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024

1/24/2024 Column Public Notice
1/24/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/24/2024 Linde Gas & Equipment Inc
1/24/2024 North Country Sports
1/24/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/24/2024 Ferguson Entprs 3094
1/24/2024 In *g & P Commercial Sale
1/24/2024 Macs Minot, Nd
1/24/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/24/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/24/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/24/2024 Acme Tools Minot
1/24/2024 Galls

1/24/2024 Dive Right In Scuba Inc
1/24/2024 Galls

1/24/2024 Home Of Economy-#4
1/24/2024 Staples Inc

1/24/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/24/2024 Carquest Auto

1/24/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/24/2024 The Home Depot #3703
1/24/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/25/2024 Law Enforcement Seminars
1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/25/2024 Hebron Brick - Minot
1/25/2024 Spi*direct Service
1/25/2024 Att

1/25/2024 Efile/Formstax
1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/25/2024 limc

1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/25/2024 Dacotah Paper Co
1/25/2024 Dakota Supply Group - Ws
1/25/2024 Att

1/25/2024 Muus Lumber And Hardware-

1/25/2024 Att

1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/25/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/25/2024 Intl Code Council Inc
1/25/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/25/2024 Holiday Inn Express Hote
1/25/2024 Officemax/Depot 6869
1/25/2024 Office Depot #1090
1/25/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/25/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/25/2024 Carquest Auto

17.94
143.60
54.86
24.00
191.97
315.08
331.39
63.70
178.20
265.99
171.88
4,507.00
87.41
2,522.00
57.98
(44.98)
29.38
146.93
233.08
59.66
149.40
70.99
425.00
15.99
11.75
157.98
2,067.52
19.00
15.98
225.00
29.45
2,438.31
49.62
391.80
35.00
183.76
134.35
10.07
29.97
473.00
242.95
316.35
59.67
33.88
30.34
84.45
(233.08)



1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/29/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024

1/25/2024 Carquest Auto
1/25/2024 Officemax/Depot 6513
1/25/2024 Holiday Inn Express Hote
1/25/2024 Cenex Tri Ener09909854
1/25/2024 Best Western Hotels
1/25/2024 Best Western Hotels
1/25/2024 Best Western Hotels
1/25/2024 Holiday Inn Express Hote
1/26/2024 Fastenal Company 01ndmin
1/26/2024 Delta Air

1/26/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/26/2024 Paypa

1/26/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/26/2024 Flower Central
1/26/2024 Dmv Arrowhead Shopping C
1/26/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/26/2024 Rdoce Min 020107
1/26/2024 Verizonwrlss

1/26/2024 Five Below 4059
1/26/2024 Border States Industries
1/26/2024 The Ups Store 1423
1/26/2024 Batteries Plus #0639
1/26/2024 Delta Air

1/26/2024 Hotelbookingservfee
1/26/2024 Priceln*hilton Garden
1/26/2024 Napa Parts 0027632
1/26/2024 Sherwin Williams 703380
1/26/2024 Hampton Inns
1/26/2024 Hampton Inns
1/26/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/26/2024 Vistaprint Corporate Solu
1/26/2024 Baker-Taylor

1/26/2024 Baker-Taylor

1/26/2024 National Safety Council
1/27/2024 Municipay*service Fee
1/27/2024 Cash Wise Foods #30
1/27/2024 Amazon Prime
1/27/2024 Lakeshore Learning Mater
1/27/2024 Walmart.Com

1/27/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/27/2024 Fedex270253079200
1/28/2024 Adobe Inc.

1/28/2024 Adobe Inc.

1/29/2024 Northeast K9 Condition
1/29/2024 Amzn Mktp Us
1/23/2024 Hawthorn Suites By Wyndha
1/26/2024 Home Of Economy-#4

165.83
298.94
288.90
52.00
208.90
208.90
208.90
288.90
102.20
602.20
263.87
150.00
129.96
104.99
13.00
241.86
3.89
345.30
21.00
38.02
51.27
244.00
1,077.20
15.99
1,458.36
67.99
468.01
106.08
0.92
62.71
140.60
108.75
456.20
65.00
1.50
19.33
139.00
25.98
10.15
38.98
11.45
21.49
21.49
97.00
24.99
(9.22)
2.17



1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024
1/30/2024

1/28/2024 Menards Minot Nd
1/29/2024 Macs Minot, Nd
1/29/2024 Gemar Photography
1/29/2024 General Trading Company
1/29/2024 Fastenal Company 01ndmin
1/29/2024 Tractor-Supply-Co #0130
1/29/2024 Suds And Sun

1/29/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/29/2024 Best Buy 00010637
1/29/2024 Best Buy 00010637
1/29/2024 Icma Online

1/29/2024 Schocks Safe And Lock Se
1/29/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/29/2024 Red Wing Shoe #739
1/29/2024 Grainger

1/29/2024 Grainger

1/29/2024 Firstout Rescue Equipment
1/29/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

1/29/2024 Amzn Mktp Us

38.91
9.98
300.00
219.50
131.46
89.99
12.00
31.99
52.98
79.96
200.00
7.90
68.97
200.00
949.60
833.25
1,051.38
137.42
83.97

$ 341,089.51



BUDGETED 2024 GENERAL FUND ADMINISTRATIVE AND OVERHEAD CHARGES

Charge these funds:
100 Airport $ 27,082.17
120 Cemetery 4,865.58
125 Parking Authoirty 376.25
130 Garbage
Collection 21,274.42
Landfill 30,171.00
140 Water/Sewer
Storm Sewer Maintenance 11,885.75
Water Supply 61,993.66
Water Distribution 42.874.00
Sewer 27,438.83
Utility Billing 6,772.42
150 Renaissance Parking Ramp 381.42
150 Central Parking Ramp 381.42
205 Public Transportation 8,166.75
210 Library 8,796.00
Total Transferred $ 252,459.67
Electronic Payments:
AFLAC
BCBS 414,334.55
BCBS Rebate (11,825.11)
Federal Tax Withholding -
Deferred Comp
NDPERS
Empower 76,510.65
Verendrye
Montana Dakota Utilities 16,206.23
Xcel Energy 96,261.32
Discovery Benefits 8,272.76
ADP Payroll taxes wire 01/05/24 &
01/20/28,24 295,499.41
ADP Payroll Wage garnishment
01/05/24 & 01/20/2024 12,481.47

ADP Payroll Taxes wire Alderman

ADP Payroll Taxes wire Pension -
State Treasurer -
Stop payment Check # -
Stop payment Check # -
CFP-ASA interest -
ADP FEES ADP PAYROLL FEES

CCD 925029963318

Total $ 907,741.28




TO:

FROM:
DATE:

City of Minots

Mayor Tom Ross
Members of the City Council

Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk
February 5, 2024

SUBJECT: GAMING SITE AUTHORIZATION

VI.

VII.

RECOMMENDED ACTION

It is recommended City Council approve the following organizations to conduct games of
chance at the following locations:

Companions for Children (February 5, 2024 - June 30, 2024)
e The Putt District (17 S Main St)
e The Blue Rider (118 1st Ave SE)

DEPARTMENT CONTACT PERSONS

John Klug, Police Chief 857-9800
Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk 857-4752

DESCRIPTION

Background
Site approval by the City Council is required as a precondition to obtain a state games of

chance license. Each organization submits documentation annually in order to conduct games
of chance at locations throughout the city of Minot. These organizations have submitted
documentation and received approval from the Police Chief.

IMPACT:

Fiscal Impact:
The City of Minot receives $100 per site authorization, which is deposited into the appropriate

general fund revenue account.

ALTERNATIVES
The City Council could deny an application if there is reasonable cause to do so and the
establishment would not be permitted to conduct games of chance.

TIME CONSTRAINTS
Site authorizations must be approved in a timely manner in order for organizations to submit
their approved gaming form to the Attorney General’s Office.

LIST OF ATTACHMENTS
A. None

Page 1 of 1



City of Minot

TO: Mayor Tom Ross
Members of the City Council

FROM: Mikayla McWilliams
DATE: February 5, 2024
SUBJECT: ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGE LICENSE RENEWAL - SAUL'S

l. RECOMMENDED ACTION
It is recommended City Council approve the alcoholic beverage license renewal for
Saul’s at 105 1%t St SE (basement) for the period of February 5, 2024 through
December 31, 2024.

. DEPARTMENT CONTACT PERSONS

John Klug, Chief of Police 857-9800
Mikayla McWilliams, City Clerk 857-4752

1l. DESCRIPTION

A. Background
In order to renew an alcoholic beverage license, an application must be
submitted for review by the Police Department and inspections are done by the
Building Official and Fire Marshal. Complete renewal applications approved by
the Police Chief.

B. Proposed Project
N/A

C. Consultant Selection
N/A

V. IMPACT:

A. Strategic Impact:
B. Service/Delivery Impact:

C. FEiscal Impact:
The fees vary depending on the type of license and are deposited into the
appropriate general fund revenue account.

V. CITY COUNCIL ASPIRATIONS
The Safe and Welcoming aspiration aligns with this process by ensuring each license
holder follows the City of Minot and State of ND laws pertaining to alcohol licensing.

V1. ALTERNATIVES
The City Council could deny a license renewal application if there is reasonable cause to
do so, and the establishment would not be permitted to sell alcohol until obtaining a
local alcoholic beverage license
VII. TIME CONSTRAINTS

Page 1 of 2



The current license expired at 11:59 pm on December 31st of 2023. If the

establishment is planning to continue the sale of alcohol, the license renewal needs to
be approved by City Council prior to that time.
VIII. LIST OF ATTACHMENTS

Page 2 of 2



City of Minoty

TO: Mayor Tom Ross

Members of the City Council
FROM: Doug Diedrichsen, Principal Planner
DATE: January 18, 2024

SUBJECT: MINOR SUBDIVISION PLAT TO BE KNOWN AS WEST MINOT 2ND
ADDITION TO<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>